111TH CONGRESS REPORT
9d Session HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 111-451

VETERANS EMPLOYMENT AND HOME PRESERVATION
ACT OF 2010

MARCH 22, 2010.—Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State
of the Union and ordered to be printed

Mr. FILNER, from the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs,
submitted the following

REPORT

[To accompany H.R. 3976]

[Including cost estimate of the Congressional Budget Office]

The Committee on Veterans’ Affairs, to whom was referred the
bill (H.R. 3976) to extend certain expiring provisions providing en-
hanced protections for servicemembers relating to mortgages and
mortgage foreclosure, having considered the same, report favorably
thereon with amendments and recommend that the bill as amend-
ed do pass.

CONTENTS

]

Pag
Amendment .........cccceerenne et e e ttee e teeee i —tee e teeeabtee e bt e e e haeeeenbteesnbaeeeanbaeeenbaeeas
Purpose and SUMmMATY ......ccccoiieiiiiieiiieeeeeeeee et et eaee e e e s saee e sevaeeeeaaeeens
Background and Need for Legislation ...........ccocccovoeiiiiniiniiiniiiieicececeeeeee,
HeEATINGS  oiiioiiiieiiiee ettt e e et e st e e s ba e e s ebaeesabaeeas
Subcommittee Consideration ..........ccccoceeiiiiiiiniieniineeeeeeeee e
Committee ConSideration .......c..ccoccierieeiiieniieiiiienie ettt ettt s siee e
ComMILEEE VOLES ..eviiuiiiiiiieriieienieete ettt sttt ettt ettt b e nae s
Committee Oversight FINdings ........cccccocciiiviiiiieeiiieeciieeeiee e e sne e
Statement of General Performance Goals and Objectives ..........cccceeceenienieannnn.
New Budget Authority, Entitlement Authority, and Tax Expenditures .............
Earmarks and Tax and Tariff Benefits .........cccccoviiiiiiniinniiniiieeeeeee,
Committee Cost Estimate ......ccccoccoiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieete e
Congressional Budget Office Cost Estimate .......cccccceevieniieiiiniiiiieciecceeieeee
Federal Mandates Statement .....
Advisory Committee Statement ... .
Constitutional Authority Statement ............ccccoevieriiiiiieiiiieiieiieeeeee e
Applicability to Legislative Branch ...
Section-by-Section Analysis of the Legislation ..........ccccoocceiviiiiiiiiiiniiiniinieeen.
Changes 1n Existing Law Made by the Bill, as Reported .......c..cccoocerviininienennen.

WO -TI-I-JUTOTUTUTOTUT I A W W N

89-006



2

AMENDMENT

The amendments are as follows:
Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

f’ggilsofxct may be cited as the “Veterans Employment and Home Preservation Act

o .

SEC. 2. EXTENSION OF ENHANCED PROTECTIONS FOR SERVICEMEMBERS RELATING TO
MORTGAGES AND MORTGAGE FORECLOSURE UNDER SERVICEMEMBERS CIVIL RE-
LIEF ACT.

(a) EXTENSION.—Paragraph (2) of section 2203(c) of the Housing and Economic
Recovery Act of 2008 (Public Law 110-289) is amended—

(1) by striking “December 31, 2010” and inserting “December 31, 2015”; and

(2) by striking “January 1, 2011” and inserting “January 1, 2016”.

(b) PROTECTION FOR SURVIVING SPOUSE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Section 303 of the Servicemembers Civil Relief Act (50
U.S.C. App. 533) is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:

“(e) PROTECTION FOR SURVIVING SPOUSE.—With respect to a servicemember who
dies while in military service and whose death is service-connected, this section
shall apply to the surviving spouse of the servicemember if such spouse is the suc-
cessor in interest to property covered under subsection (a).”.

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—Subsection (e) of section 303 of such Act, as added by
paragraph (1), shall apply to a surviving spouse of a servicemember whose
death is on or after the date of the enactment of this Act.

SEC. 3. TEMPORARY REDUCTION OF REQUIRED AMOUNT OF WAGES FOR ON-THE-JOB TRAIN-
ING PROGRAMS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—

(1) REDUCING REQUIREMENT.—Clause (ii) of section 3677(b)(1)(A) of title 38,
United States Code, is amended by striking “85 per centum” and inserting “60
percent”.

(2) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by paragraph (1) shall take ef-
fect on October 1, 2010, and shall apply to a veteran who enrolls in a program
(éf training on the job approved under section 3677 of such title on or after such

ate.

(b) SUNSET.—

(1) REVERSION.—Effective October 1, 2013, clause (ii) of section 3677(b)(1)(A)
of title 38, United States Code, as amended by subsection (a) of this section,
is amended by striking “60 percent” and inserting “85 percent”.

(2) APPLICATION.—The amendment made by paragraph (1) shall apply to a
veteran who enrolls in a program of training on the job approved under section
3677 of such title on or after October 1, 2013.

(¢) GAO REPORT.—Not later than October 1, 2013, the Comptroller General of the
United States shall submit to the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs of the House of
Representatives and the Committee on Veterans’ Affairs of the Senate a report on
the effects of the amendment made by subsection (a)(1) that reduces the wage in-
crease requirement under section 3677(b)(1)(A)(ii) of title 38, United States Code.

Amend the title so as to read:

A bill to extend certain expiring provisions providing enhanced
protections for servicemembers relating to mortgages and mortgage
foreclosure, and for other purposes.

PURPOSE AND SUMMARY

H.R. 3976 was introduced by Representative Thomas S. P.
Perriello of Virginia, on October 29, 2009. H.R. 3976, as amended,
would amend Public Law 110-289 (122 Stat. 2654), the “Housing
and Economic Recovery Act of 2008,” by extending through Decem-
ber 31, 2015, specified protections for servicemembers relating to
mortgages and mortgage foreclosures. In addition, H.R. 3976 was
amended to include the provisions of H.R. 4079, which would
amend title 38, United States Code, to temporarily reduce the in-
crease in wages paid by employers to veterans enrolled in on-the-



3

job training (OJT) programs. H.R. 4079 was introduced by Rep-
resentative Thomas S. P. Perriello of Virginia on November 16,
2009.

BACKGROUND AND NEED FOR LEGISLATION

The “Housing and Economic Recovery Act of 2008,” Public Law
110-289 (122 Stat. 2654), amended the Servicemembers Civil Re-
lief Act (50 U.S.C. App. 501 et seq.) to provide servicemembers pro-
tection against mortgage foreclosure and extended the period for an
extension of stay of proceedings from 90 days to nine months. The
extension for protection against foreclosure is slated to expire on
December 31, 2010, and the extension of the period for a stay of
proceedings is due to expire on January 1, 2011.

H.R. 3976, would amend section 2203 of Public Law 110-289
(122 Stat. 2654, 2849) by extending those enhanced protections for
servicemembers relating to mortgages and mortgage foreclosure
under Servicemembers Civil Relief Act for an additional five years.
This bill also allows surviving spouses of servicemembers who have
died while in military service, to receive protection against mort-
gage foreclosure and a stay of proceedings if the individual is the
successor in interest to the servicemember’s property and the
servicemember’s death was service-connected. The provisions of the
bill also would be effective on or after date of enactment.

Section 3 of H.R. 3976, as amended to include provisions from
H.R. 4079, would amend section 3677 of title 38, United States
Code, to reduce the final statutory on-the-job training wage in-
crease from 85 percent to 60 percent of a fully qualified employee
to allow additional businesses to participate in this program. The
National Association of State Approving Agencies stated that due
to the economic climate, many businesses are unable to participate
in the OJT training program due to the statutory requirement that
the employer must increase the wage paid to a veteran partici-
pating in OJT. That inability to increase the wages by the statu-
tory amount has resulted in fewer OJT opportunities for veterans.
Currently, an employer is required to provide a beginning wage of
at least 50 percent of the wage for fully-trained employees, there-
fore only a ten percent increase wage is required but this increase
can be exceeded at the employer’s discretion.

As part of a three-year pilot program, the Government Account-
ability Office would be required to submit a report to Congress on
the effects of reducing the wage increase requirements at the end
of the pilot program.

HEARINGS

On February 25, 2010, the Subcommittee on Economic Oppor-
tunity conducted a legislative hearing on various bills introduced
during the 111th Congress, including H.R. 3976 and H.R. 4079.
The Following witnesses testified: The Honorable John J. Hall of
New York; The Honorable Adam H. Putnam of Florida; The Honor-
able Joe Sestak of Pennsylvania; The Honorable Adam Smith of
Washington; The Honorable Michael R. Turner of Ohio; Mr. Robert
W. Madden, Assistant Director, National Economic Commission,
The American Legion; Mr. Justin Brown, Legislative Associate, Na-
tional Legislative Service, Veterans of Foreign Wars; Mr. Timothy



4

S. Embree, Legislative Associate, Iraq and Afghanistan Veterans of
America; Mr. James Bombard, Legislative Director, National Asso-
ciation of State Approving Agencies; Mr. Mark E. Sullivan, Law Of-
fices of Mark E. Sullivan, P.A.; Col. Shawn Shumake, U.S. Army,
Director, Office of Legal Policy, Office of the Under Secretary of De-
fense (Personnel and Readiness), Program Integration and Legal
Policy, U.S. Department of Defense; Mr. Keith M. Wilson, Director
of Education Service, Veterans Benefits Administration, U.S. De-
partment of Veterans Affairs, accompanied by Mr. Mark Bologna,
Director of Loan Guaranty Service, Veteran Benefits Administra-
tion, U.S. Department of Veterans Affairs and Mr. F. John Brizzi,
Jr., Deputy Assistant General Counsel, U.S. Department of Vet-
erans Affairs. Those submitting statements for the record included:
The Honorable Bob Filner of California; The Honorable Ron Klein
of Florida; Ms. Patricia E. Apy, American Bar Association; Ms.
Stacy Bannerman of Medford, Oregon; Ms. Kelly Hruska, Govern-
ment Relations Deputy Director, National Military Family Associa-
tion; Mr. Brian Hawthorne, Legislative Director, Student Veterans
of America; and, the Pennsylvania Association of Private School
Administrators.

SUBCOMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

On March 4, 2010, the Subcommittee on Economic Opportunity
met in open markup session and ordered favorably forwarded to
the full Committee H.R. 3976, as amended, and H.R. 4079, as
amended, by voice vote. During consideration of the bill the fol-
lowing amendment was considered:

An amendment by Mr. Perriello of Virginia to make a technical
correction by striking the word “Recover” and insert “Recovery”
was agreed to by voice vote.

During consideration of H.R. 4079 the following amendment in
the nature of a substitute was considered:

An amendment in the nature of a substitute by Mr. Perriello
of Virginia to make a change to the bill that would cap the
wage increase percentage at 60 percent, terminate the program
in three years, and require GAO to submit a report to Con-
gress was agreed to by voice vote.

COMMITTEE CONSIDERATION

On March 10, 2010, the full Committee met in an open markup
session, a quorum being present, and ordered H.R. 3976, as amend-
ed, reported favorably to the House of Representatives, by voice
vote. During consideration of the bill the following amendment was
considered:

An amendment in the nature of a substitute offered by Mr.
Perriello of Virginia incorporating the provisions of H.R. 4079,
as amended, and providing for a new short title was agreed to
by voice vote.

COMMITTEE VOTES

Clause 3(b) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House of Representa-
tives requires the Committee to list the record votes on the motion
to report the legislation and amendments thereto. There were no
record votes taken on amendments or in connection with ordering



5

H.R. 3976 reported to the House. A motion by Mr. Miller of Florida
to order H.R. 3976, as amended, reported favorably to the House
of Representatives was agreed to by voice vote.

COMMITTEE OVERSIGHT FINDINGS

In compliance with clause 3(c)(1) of rule XIII and clause (2)(b)(1)
of rule X of the Rules of the House of Representatives, the Commit-
tee’s oversight findings and recommendations are reflected in the
descriptive portions of this report.

STATEMENT OF GENERAL PERFORMANCE GOALS AND OBJECTIVES

In accordance with clause 3(¢)(4) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee’s performance goals and
objectives are reflected in the descriptive portions of this report.

NEW BUDGET AUTHORITY, ENTITLEMENT AUTHORITY, AND TAX
EXPENDITURES

In compliance with clause 3(c)(2) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee adopts as its own the es-
timate of new budget authority, entitlement authority, or tax ex-
penditures or revenues contained in the cost estimate prepared by
the Director of the Congressional Budget Office pursuant to section
402 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974.

EARMARKS AND TAX AND TARIFF BENEFITS

H.R. 3976 does not contain any congressional earmarks; limited
tax benefits, or limited tariff benefits as defined in clause 9 of rule
XXI of the Rules of the House of Representatives.

COMMITTEE COST ESTIMATE

The Committee adopts as its own the cost estimate on H.R. 3976
prepared by the Director of the Congressional Budget Office pursu-
ant to section 402 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974.

CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET OFFICE COST ESTIMATE

Pursuant to clause 3(¢)(3) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the following is the cost estimate for H.R. 3976

provided by the Congressional Budget Office pursuant to section
402 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974:

U.S. CONGRESS,
CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET OFFICE,
Washington, DC, March 16, 2010.

Hon. BoB FILNER,
Chairman, Committee on Veterans’ Affairs,
House of Representatives, Washington, DC.

DEAR MR. CHAIRMAN: The Congressional Budget Office has pre-
pared the enclosed cost estimate for H.R. 3976, the Veterans Em-
ployment and Home Preservation Act of 2010.



6

If you wish further details on this estimate, we will be pleased
to provide them. The CBO staff contact is Camille Woodland.
Sincerely,
DoucLAs W. ELMENDORF,
Director.

Enclosure.

H.R. 3976—Veterans Employment and Home Preservation Act of
2010

Summary: H.R. 3976 would temporarily loosen requirements nec-
essary for veterans to receive benefit payments from the Depart-
ment of Veterans Affairs (VA) for participating in on-the-job train-
ing. CBO estimates that implementing the bill would increase di-
rect spending by $9 million over the 2011-2020 period.

Pay-as-you-go procedures apply because enacting the legislation
would affect direct spending.

H.R. 3976 contains no intergovernmental mandates as defined in
the Unfunded Mandates Reform Act (UMRA).

H.R. 3976 would impose private-sector mandates, as defined in
UMRA, on certain mortgage holders and other creditors. Based on
information from industry sources, CBO expects that the cost of
those mandates would fall below the annual threshold for private-
sector mandates ($141 million in 2010, adjusted annually for infla-
tion).

Estimated cost to the Federal Government: The estimated budg-
etary impact of H.R. 3976 is shown in the following table. The costs
of this legislation fall within budget function 700 (veterans benefits
and services).

By fiscal year, in millions of dollars—

2011- 2011-

2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020 2015 2020

CHANGES IN DIRECT SPENDING

Estimated Budget ................. 2 2 3 1 * 0 0 0 0 0 9 9
Authority Estimated Outlays .. 2 2 3 1 * 0 0 0 0 0 9 9

Note: * = less than $500,000. Annual costs do not sum to totals because of rounding.

Basis of estimate: VA provides education benefits to certain vet-
erans participating in on-the-job training programs. Under current
law, for such programs to be eligible for coverage under veterans
benefits, the employer must pay trainees a starting wage equaling
at least 50 percent of the full-time wage for that position. That
amount must steadily increase to at least 85 percent of the appro-
priate full-time wage by the last month of the program.

Section 3 would temporarily reduce the requirement for final pay
to no less than 60 percent for veterans who begin training in fiscal
years 2011 through 2013. CBO expects that such a change would
increase the number of on-the-job training programs that VA would
approve for use of education benefits; thus, CBO estimates that an
additional 260 veterans would receive an average of $7,000 in bene-
fits from VA annually from 2011 through 2015. CBO estimates that
implementing H.R. 3976 would increase direct spending by $9 mil-
lion over the 2010-2020 period.

Pay-as-you-go considerations: The Statutory Pay-As-You-Go Act
of 2010 establishes budget reporting and enforcement procedures
for legislation affecting direct spending or revenues. The net



7

changes in outlays and revenues that are subject to those pay-as-
you-go procedures are shown in the following table.

CBO ESTIMATE OF PAY-AS-YOU-GO EFFECTS FOR H.R. 3976 AS ORDERED REPORTED BY THE
HOUSE COMMITTEE ON VETERANS" AFFAIRS ON MARCH 10, 2010

By fiscal year, in millions of dollars—

2010-  2010-

2010 2011 2012 2013 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018 2019 2020  “ype 2020

NET INCREASE IN THE DEFICIT

Statutory Pay-As-
You-Go Impact ... 0 2 2 3 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 9 9

Note: Annual costs do not sum to totals because of rounding.

Estimated impact on state, local, and tribal governments: H.R.
3976 contains no intergovernmental mandates as defined in UMRA
and would impose no costs on state, local, or tribal governments.

Estimated impact on the private sector: Section 2 would extend
the expiration date by five years of enhanced protections for
servicemembers under the Servicemembers Civil Relief Act (SCRA)
relating to mortgages and mortgage foreclosures. Furthermore, it
would extend mortgage-related protections under the SCRA to sur-
viving spouses of servicemembers who die while in military service.
Those changes would constitute mandates on mortgage holders.
The cost of complying with these mandates would be the loss asso-
ciated with delayed mortgage payments, delayed foreclosure, and
interest-rate limitations. Based on historical separation rates, fore-
closure rates, and mortgage-interest rates, CBO expects that the
cost of the mandate would be small relative to the annual thresh-
old for private-sector mandates ($141 million in 2010, adjusted an-
nually for inflation).

Estimate prepared by: Federal Costs: Camille Woodland and
David Newman; Impact on State, Local, and Tribal Governments:
Lisa Ramirez-Branum; Impact on the Private Sector: Elizabeth
Bass.

Estimate approved by: Theresa Gullo, Deputy Assistant Director
for Budget Analysis.

FEDERAL MANDATES STATEMENT

The Committee adopts as its own the estimate of Federal man-
dates regarding H.R. 3976 prepared by the Director of the Congres-
sional Budget Office pursuant to section 423 of the Unfunded Man-
dates Reform Act.

ADVISORY COMMITTEE STATEMENT

No advisory committees within the meaning of section 5(b) of the
Federal Advisory Committee Act would be created by H.R. 3976.

CONSTITUTIONAL AUTHORITY STATEMENT

Pursuant to clause 3(d)(1) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the Committee finds that the Constitutional au-
thority for H.R. 3976 is provided by Article I, section 8 of the Con-
stitution of the United States.



8

APPLICABILITY TO LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

The Committee finds that the legislation does not relate to the
terms and conditions of employment or access to public services or
accommodations within the meaning of section 102(b)(3) of the Con-
gressional Accountability Act.

SECTION-BY-SECTION ANALYSIS OF THE LEGISLATION

Section 1. Short title

This section provides the short title of H.R. 3976, as amended,
as the “Veterans Employment and Home Preservation Act of 2010.”

Section 2. Extension of enhanced protections for servicemembers re-
lating to mortgages and mortgage foreclosure under
Servicemembers Civil Relief Act

This section extends the protection against mortgage foreclosure
of nine months until December 31, 2015, and maintains the stay
of proceedings period of nine months until January 1, 2016.

This section allows surviving spouses of servicemembers who
have died while in military service and their death is service-con-
nected, to receive protection against mortgage foreclosure and a
stay of proceedings if the individual is the successor in interest to
the servicemember’s property and the servicemember’s death was
service-connected.

This section also establishes an effective date of on or after date
of enactment of this Act.

Section 3. Temporary reduction of required amount of wages for on-
the-job training programs

This section reduces the wage increase from 85 percent to 60 per-
cent with the wage increase taking place no later than the last full
month of the training period. This section provides an effective
date of October 1, 2010, and would apply to individuals partici-
pating in this program on or after such date. This section sunsets
the pilot program on October 1, 2013, and requires that U.S. Gov-
ernment Accountability Office submit a report to Congress on the
effect of reducing the wage increase requirements.

CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS REPORTED

In compliance with clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, changes in existing law made by the bill,
as reported, are shown as follows (existing law proposed to be omit-
ted is enclosed in black brackets, new matter is printed in italic,
existing law in which no change is proposed is shown in roman):

SECTION 2203 OF THE HOUSING AND ECONOMIC
RECOVERY ACT OF 2008

SEC. 2203. ENHANCEMENT OF PROTECTIONS FOR SERVICEMEMBERS
gE(IiéTIN% TO MORTGAGES AND MORTGAGE FORE-
LOSURES.

(a) kock ok
* £ * * * £ *
(¢c) EFFECTIVE DATE; SUNSET.—



(1) * * *

(2) SUNSET.—The amendments made by subsection (a) shall
expire on [December 31, 20101 December 31, 2015. Effective
[January 1, 20111 January 1, 2016, the provisions of sub-
sections (b) and (c) of section 303 of the Servicemembers Civil
Relief Act, as in effect on the day before the date of the enact-
ment of this Act, are hereby revived.

SERVICEMEMBERS CIVIL RELIEF ACT

* * * * * * *

TITLE III—RENT, INSTALLMENT CON-
TRACTS, MORTGAGES, LIENS, ASSIGN-
MENT, LEASES

* * *k & * * *

SEC. 303. MORTGAGES AND TRUST DEEDS.
(a) * * *

* * * * * * *

(e) PROTECTION FOR SURVIVING SPOUSE.—With respect to a serv-
icemember who dies while in military service and whose death is
service-connected, this section shall apply to the surviving spouse of
the servicemember if such spouse is the successor in interest to prop-
erty covered under subsection (a).

* * & & * * &

SECTION 3677 OF TITLE 38, UNITED STATES CODE

§3677. Approval of training on the job

(a) kock ok

(b)(1) The training establishment offering training which is de-
sired to be approved for the purposes of this chapter must submit
to the appropriate State approving agency a written application for
approval which, in addition to furnishing such information as is re-
quired by the State approving agency, contains a certification
that—

(A) the wages to be paid the eligible veteran or person (i)
upon entrance into training, are not less than wages paid non-
veterans in the same training position and are at least 50 per
centum of the wages paid for the job for which the veteran or
person is to be trained, and (ii) such wages will be increased
in regular periodic increments until, not later than the last full
month of the training period, they will be at least [85 per cen-
tum] 60 percent of the wages paid for the job for which such
eligible veteran or person is being trained; and

* * * & * * *



10

[Effective October 1, 2010, clause (ii) of section 3677(b)(1)(A), as amended by section
3(a) of H.R. 3976, appears below. Effective October 1, 2013, section 3(b) of H.R.
3976, provides for an amendment to such clause as follows:]

§3677. Approval of training on the job

(a) kock ok

(b)(1) The training establishment offering training which is de-
sired to be approved for the purposes of this chapter must submit
to the appropriate State approving agency a written application for
approval which, in addition to furnishing such information as is re-
quired by the State approving agency, contains a certification
that—

(A) the wages to be paid the eligible veteran or person (i)
upon entrance into training, are not less than wages paid non-
veterans in the same training position and are at least 50 per
centum of the wages paid for the job for which the veteran or
person is to be trained, and (ii) such wages will be increased
in regular periodic increments until, not later than the last full
month of the training period, they will be at least [60 percentl
85 percent of the wages paid for the job for which such eligible
veteran or person is being trained; and

* * k & * * k

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Gray Gamma 2.2)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /OK
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.1000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
    /Arial-Black
    /Arial-BlackItalic
    /Arial-BoldItalicMT
    /Arial-BoldMT
    /Arial-ItalicMT
    /ArialMT
    /ArialNarrow
    /ArialNarrow-Bold
    /ArialNarrow-BoldItalic
    /ArialNarrow-Italic
    /ArialUnicodeMS
    /CenturyGothic
    /CenturyGothic-Bold
    /CenturyGothic-BoldItalic
    /CenturyGothic-Italic
    /CourierNewPS-BoldItalicMT
    /CourierNewPS-BoldMT
    /CourierNewPS-ItalicMT
    /CourierNewPSMT
    /Georgia
    /Georgia-Bold
    /Georgia-BoldItalic
    /Georgia-Italic
    /Impact
    /LucidaConsole
    /Tahoma
    /Tahoma-Bold
    /TimesNewRomanMT-ExtraBold
    /TimesNewRomanPS-BoldItalicMT
    /TimesNewRomanPS-BoldMT
    /TimesNewRomanPS-ItalicMT
    /TimesNewRomanPSMT
    /Trebuchet-BoldItalic
    /TrebuchetMS
    /TrebuchetMS-Bold
    /TrebuchetMS-Italic
    /Verdana
    /Verdana-Bold
    /Verdana-BoldItalic
    /Verdana-Italic
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 150
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 150
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.00000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.00000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (None)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e55464e1a65876863768467e5770b548c62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc666e901a554652d965874ef6768467e5770b548c52175370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata pogodnih za pouzdani prikaz i ispis poslovnih dokumenata koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF adatti per visualizzare e stampare documenti aziendali in modo affidabile. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 5.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020be44c988b2c8c2a40020bb38c11cb97c0020c548c815c801c73cb85c0020bcf4ace00020c778c1c4d558b2940020b3700020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken waarmee zakelijke documenten betrouwbaar kunnen worden weergegeven en afgedrukt. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents suitable for reliable viewing and printing of business documents.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [600 600]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


