

**GOVERNMENT REFORM COMMITTEE
STAFF REPORT – ATTACHMENT
September 29, 2006**

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records

This document contains the entries in the billing records provided to the Committee by Greenberg Traurig that include references to White House officials.

In some instances, a single lobbying contact with White House officials appears in the billing records on multiple occasions, such as when the lobbying contact is billed to more than one client or when there is one entry in the billing record for time and a second entry for expenses incurred. In this document, these duplicate entries are presented as they appear in the billing records. In tabulating the total number of lobbying contacts in the accompanying Committee staff report, the duplicate entries were combined and counted as a single instance of lobbying.

The billing record entries often aggregate many activities into a single listing. In these cases, it is not possible to determine how much of the time billed was expended in lobbying White House officials.

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
1/26/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with R. Christie (Domestic Policy Adviser, VP Cheney) regarding Choctaw and GOP Native American Agenda; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Choctaw	5.1		GTG004231-ACCT-CW
1/29/2001	Tony Rudy	Discussed with White House staff critical issues pertaining to staffing of Interior and Native American policy in Administration	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004232-ACCT-CW
2/2/2001	Padgett Wilson	Meet with Mary Beth Farr (Administration) regarding contacts in the Department of Interior; [REDACTED]	Chitimacha	0.9		GTG018255-ACCT-CM
2/5/2001	James F. Miller	Discussions with and memos to White House and Interior Department regarding Bush Indian agenda.	Choctaw	2.8		GTG004189-ACCT-CW
2/6/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] meeting with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] regarding Interior Department and tribes; meeting with K. Bullock (Bush) regarding the same; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.1		GTG004191-ACCT-CW
2/8/2001	James F. Miller	discussions with and memos to White House and Interior Department regarding BIA position and tribal policies and agenda	Choctaw	4.0		GTG004192-ACCT-CW
2/9/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] [REDACTED] phone conference with K. Yeager (Bush) regarding Choctaw and NIGC positions; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Choctaw	6.4		GTG005921-ACCT-CW
2/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with K. Yeager (Bush) regarding Choctaw and NIGC; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG005923-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
2/14/2001	Tony Rudy	[REDACTED] contact White House regarding key positions in Interior Department affecting tribes.	Choctaw	3.5		GTG005923-ACCT-CW
2/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	lunch at Politiki with C. Hutto (DOE), R. Christine (VP Cheney), S.R. (House Judiciary), DOE staff on 2-18-01	Choctaw		\$77.71	GTG005934-ACCT-CW
2/23/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with K. Yeager (Bush) regarding NIGC; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.7		GTG005928-ACCT-CW
2/27/2001	Tony Rudy	Discussion with White House staff regarding the appointment of BIA director; obtain letters of support for BIA candidate; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.5		GTG005929-ACCT-CW
3/6/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with [REDACTED] regarding Interior Department and tribes; call to K Bullock (Bush) regarding the same; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.1		GTG-R005286
3/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with K. Yeager (Bush) regarding Choctaw and NIGC; [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; meeting with S. Ralston (Aide to K. Rove); [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG-R005290
3/24/2001	Kevin Ring	Meet with AG Ashcroft; Meet with D. Trigg (Commerce Dept), J. Wilkinson (White House), and D. Ayres (DoJ) regarding client issues	Choctaw	4.7		GTG-R005292
3/26/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Oval Room Restaurant with Bush staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$141.80	GTG004182-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/26/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with S. Ralston (Bush) and A. Tamburrello (Stupak)	Choctaw	6.7		GTG-R005292
4/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at Bombay Club with White House staff and Todd Boulanger on 4-20-01	Choctaw		\$76.18	GTG004108-ACCT-CW
4/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with K. Yeager (Bush) regarding Choctaw and NIGC; [REDACTED] meeting with S. Ralston (Aide to K. Rove) and T. Boulanger; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004171-ACCT-CW
4/28/2001	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] Meet with White House and Commerce Department officials regarding client issues.	Choctaw	3.1		GTG4175-ACCT-CW
5/1/2001	Tony Rudy	[REDACTED] Discussions with White House staff [REDACTED]	Coushatta	4.3		GTG002479-ACCT-CS
5/2/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with S. Ralston (White House) regarding Bush legislative agenda and Interior Department staffing [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG005899-ACCT-CW
5/9/2001	Jack Abramoff	[REDACTED] follow up with S. Vasell; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.2		GTG005902-ACCT-CW
5/9/2001	Tony Rudy	Escort Chief Poncho to meetings [REDACTED] with the White House.	Coushatta	10.0		GTG002480-ACCT-CS
5/12/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at Rio Grande Café with White House Legislative Affairs staff/OMB staff on 5-12-01	Choctaw		\$62.24	GTG004133-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
5/23/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with presidential Personnel regarding Choctaw and NIGC; [REDACTED] meeting with S. Raiston (Aide to K. Rove) and T. Boulanger; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004103-ACCT-CW
5/24/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch meeting at The Dubliner with [REDACTED] White House Leg. Affairs staff	Choctaw		\$97.17	GTG004135-ACCT-CW
5/28/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch meeting at Lost Dog Café with White House Legislative Affairs and OMB staff on 5-28-01	Choctaw		\$40.56	GTG004135-ACCT-CW
5/28/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting at Bull Run Country Club with White House Legislative Affairs, OMB staff, and State Department staff on 5-28-01	Choctaw		\$85.68	GTG004136-ACCT-CW
5/28/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding appropriations and Senate; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.0		GTG005908-ACCT-CW
5/28/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB and WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding appropriations and compact.	Coushatta	3.0		GTG002483-ACCT-CS
6/1/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff on budget and appropriations matters [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG004112-ACCT-CW
6/4/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with S. Raiston (White House) regarding Bush legislative agenda and Interior Department policies; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004112-ACCT-CW
6/5/2001	Kevin Ring	Conversation with R. Barrales (White house Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding PR working group	AIC - PR	0.5		GTG-026233-ACCT-AIC
6/5/2001	Kevin Ring	Phone conversation with [REDACTED] regarding Choctaw jail; meet with R. Barrales (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding same.	Choctaw	1.2		GTG004113-ACCT-CW
6/8/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meal @ Oval Room with WH Leg. Affairs on 6/8/01	Choctaw		\$126.32	GTG004137-ACCT-CW
6/11/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meal @ Oval Room with S. Raiston (WH Domestic Policy) on 6/11/01	Choctaw		\$11.00	GTG004137-ACCT-CW
6/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ The Dubliner w/ WH Leg. Affairs Appropriations on 6/13/01	Choctaw		\$35.00	GTG004137-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
6/14/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meet with WH Leg Affairs staff regarding Choctaw	Choctaw	5.4		GTG004117-ACCT-CW
6/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with S. Ralston (White House), A. Tamburello (Stupak), and T. Boulanger, [REDACTED]	Choctaw	5.2		GTG004121-ACCT-CW
6/21/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with S. Ralston (White House), T. Martin, T. Boulanger and Chairman LeBianc at White House for President Bush send-off [REDACTED]	Chitimacha	2.4		GTG01821-ACCT-CM
7/2/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at Lobby Lounge with [REDACTED] S. Ralston of White House [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$71.57	GTG004088-ACCT-CW
7/2/2001	Kevin Ring	Dinner @ Bobby Van's Steakhouse with White House and Labor Dept. officials on 7/2/01	Choctaw		\$92.37	GTG004088-ACCT-CW
7/2/2001	Kevin Ring	Dinner at Bobby's Van's Steakhouse with White House and Labor Dept. officials.	Coushatta		\$92.37	GTG002452-ACCT-CS
7/2/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White house Legislative Affairs staff on budget and appropriations matters; [REDACTED] [REDACTED] meeting with P. Pizzella (Dept. of Labor) and S. Ralston (White House).	Choctaw	4.7		GTG004070-ACCT-CW
7/4/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at The Bottom Line with White House Leg. Aff. Staff.	Coushatta		\$69.25	GTG002452-ACCT-CS
7/4/2001	Shawn Vasell	Fairfax National Gold with White House OMB staff.	Coushatta		\$69.60	GTG002452-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
7/4/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda.	Choctaw	2.5		GTG004071-ACCT-CW
7/8/2001	Shawn Vasell	Brunch at Old Ebbitt Grill with White House legislative affairs staff.	Coushatta		\$42.35	GTG002453-ACCT-CS
7/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at The Oceanaire with White House Domestic Policy Staff.	Coushatta		\$166.99	GTG002426-ACCT-CS
7/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff regarding Choctaw; work on appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.1		GTG4078-ACCT-CW
7/17/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at the Oceanaire with White House Domestic Policy staff on 7-17-01	Choctaw		\$265.05	GTG004061-ACCT-CW
7/17/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at The Oceanaire with White House Domestic Policy staff, legal affairs staff, OMB staff, [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$265.06	GTG002426-ACCT-CS
7/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with S. Ralston (White House), White House leg. Affairs staff and OMB staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004080-ACCT-CW
8/1/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; Meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff on Budget and appropriations matters; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.8		GTG004047-ACCT-CW
8/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.7		GTG004049-ACCT-CW
8/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB, and White House legislative staff re. Approps strategies and Bush agenda [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.7		GTG002418-ACCT-CS
8/9/2001	Todd Boulanger	Ten Penh with White House [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$78.38	GTG002410-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
8/10/2001	Todd Boulanger	[REDACTED] Meet with White House legislative affairs staff and [REDACTED] to discuss tribal agenda.	Choctaw	3.4		GTG004053-ACCT-CW
8/11/2001	Shawn Vasell	The Dubliner with OMB and WH Legislative Affairs staff on 8-11-01	Choctaw		\$46.00	GTG004037-ACCT-CW
8/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	Café Asia with WH Legislative Affairs staff on 8-13-01	Choctaw		\$31.58	GTG004037-ACCT-CW
8/14/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff regarding choctaw; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG004054-ACCT-CW
8/15/2001	Seth Cropsey	Lunch at Oval Room restaurant with Mike Green, Director, Asia, NSC	AIC - Malaysia		\$54.60	GTG-026384-ACCT-AIC
8/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner @ Grub Steak Restaurant with [REDACTED]; WH leg affairs staff on 8/18/01	Choctaw		\$118.52	GTG004038-ACCT-CW
8/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED]; White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding appropriations [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.2		GTG004057-ACCT-CW
8/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED]; White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding appropriations [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.1		GTG002422-ACCT-CS
8/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meal Lakota Park City Utah w/ WH leg. Affairs staff on 9/20/01	Choctaw		\$60.00	GTG004038-ACCT-CW
8/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meal @ Sundance Resort, Sundance, Utah w/ WH leg. Affairs staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$240.00	GTG004038-ACCT-CW
8/31/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding Bush agenda post-August recess.	Choctaw	4.3		GTG004060-ACCT-CW
9/2/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch @ The Dubliner w/WH Legal affairs staff, OMB staff on 9/02/01	Choctaw		\$28.50	GTG004039-ACCT-CW
9/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner @ Rio Grande w/ WH leg. Affairs staff on 9/3/01	Choctaw		\$67.92	GTG004039-ACCT-CW
9/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff on appropriations matters [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.8		GTG004019-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
9/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG004020-ACCT-CW
9/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.7		GTG002401-ACCT-CS
9/13/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Morton's of Chicago w/ Leadership staff and WH staff on 9/13/01	Choctaw		\$533.68	GTG004041-ACCT-CW
9/13/2001	Michael Williams	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with T. Gross and D. Glenn (Bush White House staff) regarding response to terrorists attacks and Bush plans for worldwide coalition action	AIC - Malaysia	4.4		GTG-026389-ACCT-AIC
9/14/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.6		GTG004025-ACCT-CW
9/18/2001	Padgett Wilson	Lunch at Oval Room Restaurant with A. Jones (White House) on 9-18-01	Choctaw		\$21.70	GTG004042-ACCT-CW
9/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at The Oval Room with White House staff on 9-19-01	Choctaw		\$73.55	GTG004010-ACCT-CW
9/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Meeting with S. Ralston (White House); conference with N. Rogers and S. Gleason regarding 8a issue [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004028-ACCT-CW
9/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with S. Ralston (White House); [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.4		GTG002405-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
9/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff, regarding appropriations; review appropriations materials; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.2		GTG004029-ACCT-CW
9/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff	Coushatta	1.1		GTG002405-ACCT-CS
9/21/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Meeting with WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding Bush domestic agenda; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.3		GTG004030-ACCT-CW
10/1/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff and Appropriations Committee staff on appropriations projects and timing; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.8		GTG003990-ACCT-CW
10/3/2001	Kevin Ring	Lunch @ Bobby Van's Steakhouse w/ White House officials on 10/03/01	Choctaw		\$70.50	GTG004012-ACCT-CW
10/3/2001	Kevin Ring	Lunch with White House official regarding client matters, including jail project	Choctaw	1.0		GTG003991-ACCT-CW
10/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG003992-ACCT-CW
10/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.7		GTG002376-ACCT-CS
10/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House and Senate leadership staff regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG003994-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
10/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.6		GTG002377-ACCT-CS
10/7/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ The Dubliner w/ WH Leg. Affairs staff on 10/7/01	Choctaw		\$52.00	GTG004013-ACCT-CW
10/12/2001	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client appropriations needs	Choctaw	1.2		GTG003998-ACCT-CW
10/14/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ Faccia Luna Trattoria w/ WH Leg. Affairs staff on 10/14/01	Choctaw		\$47.28	GTG004014-ACCT-CW
10/16/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; Meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff and OMB regarding CJS legislation; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.9		GTG004000-ACCT-CW
10/17/2001	Todd Boulanger	Meet with White House staff to discuss tribal issues in general and background information on the Coushatta reservation (problems, successes and upcoming developments and business plans); [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.9		GTG002382-ACCT-CS
10/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch @ the Oceanaire w/White House staff; OMB staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$122.12	GTG003981-ACCT-CW
10/18/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at The Oceanaire with White House staff; OMB staff; [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$122.12	GTG002368-ACCT-CS
10/20/2001	Stephanie Leger	Beverages at Tortilla Coast with White House staff.	Chitimacha		\$12.00	GTG018307-ACCT-CM
10/21/2001	Kevin Ring	Meet with [REDACTED] and C. Bonilla (WH) regarding client issues, including jail project	Choctaw	1.9		GTG004002-ACCT-CW
10/22/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding appropriations; review appropriations materials; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG004003-ACCT-CW
10/23/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; Meeting with WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding appropriations.	Choctaw	4.3		GTG004003-ACCT-CW
10/29/2001	Todd Boulanger	Meet with White House staff to discuss tribal issues in general and background information on the Coushatta reservation (problems, successes and upcoming developments and business plans); [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.9		GTG002386-ACCT-CS
10/30/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ Bobby Van's Steak House w/ WH policy staff on 10/30/01 S. Vasell	Choctaw		\$107.45	GTG003983-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
10/30/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals at Bobby's Vans Steakhouse with WH Policy staff.	Coushatta		\$107.45	GTG002370-ACCT-CS
11/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ The Oceanaire w/ WH Leg Affairs; jail on 11/05/01 S. Vasell	Choctaw		\$182.98	GTG003984-ACCT-CW
11/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff to discuss appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG003960-ACCT-CW
11/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.7		GTG002360-ACCT-CS
11/7/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House and Senate Appropriations staff regarding appropriations and jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	5.4		GTG003962-ACCT-CW
11/7/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG002361-ACCT-CS
11/9/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with K. Mehlman (White House) regarding tribal issues; [REDACTED]	Chitimacha	1.1		GTG018310-ACCT-CM
11/9/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Meeting with K. Mehlman (White House) regarding jai; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	6.1		GTG003965-ACCT-CW
11/9/2001	Tony Rudy	Meeting with K. Mehlman at White House; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	5.0		GTG003965-ACCT-CW
11/14/2001	Tony Rudy	[REDACTED] Discussions with David Hobbs at White House.	Choctaw	3.3		GTG003986-ACCT-CW
11/16/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff and OMB regarding CJS legislation and jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.9		GTG003970-ACCT-CW
11/22/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meal @ Nathans of Georgetown w/ White House staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$111.84	GTG003946-ACCT-CW
11/26/2001	Seth Cropsey	Oval Room Restaurant with Samantha Ravich, VP Cheney staff on 11-26-01	AIC - Malaysia		\$66.00	GTG-026436-ACCT-AIC
11/26/2001	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with White House official regarding project.	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003974-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
11/26/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG003974-ACCT-CW
11/26/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED], White House Legislative Affairs staff [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.1		GTG002365-ACCT-CS
11/27/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH staff regarding jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.3		GTG003975-ACCT-CW
11/27/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with WH staff regarding tribal issues; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.6		GTG002366-ACCT-CS
11/28/2001	Michael Williams	Lunch at Capitol Hill Club with Steve Ruhlen VP Legislative Affairs on 11-28-01	Choctaw		\$27.71	GTG003947-ACCT-CW
12/1/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] attend event with White House Leg. Affairs and OMB staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.8		GTG003930-ACCT-CW
12/2/2001	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED], White House staff, and OMB staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.1		GTG003930-ACCT-CW
12/3/2001	Shawn Vasell	Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.7		GTG002342-ACCT-CS
12/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.6		GTG003932-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
12/5/2001	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.6		GTG002343-ACCT-CS
12/6/2001	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client matter.	Coushatta	1.2		GTG002343-ACCT-CS
12/14/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff and OMB regarding jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.9		GTG003938-ACCT-CW
12/19/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with WH staff regarding jail and need for DOJ to release funding; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.7		GTG003940-ACCT-CW
12/20/2001	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with [REDACTED] WH staff regarding jail appropriation; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.2		GTG003941-ACCT-CW
12/27/2001	Tony Rudy	Meeting with D. Hobbs of White House Legislative Affairs	Choctaw	3.3		GTG003942-ACCT-CW
12/31/2001	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at Café Asia with WH staff.	Coushatta		\$58.40	GTG002333-ACCT-CS
12/31/2001	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Bobby Van's Steakhouse with WH officials.	Coushatta		\$87.15	GTG002333-ACCT-CS
12/31/2001	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Bobby Van's Steakhouse w/ WH official on 12/31/01 K. Ring	Choctaw		\$87.17	GTG003954-ACCT-CW
1/4/2002	Kevin Ring	Meals at Mortons of Chicago with White House officials.	Coushatta		\$43.24	GTG002334-ACCT-CS
1/4/2002	Kevin Ring	Meals at Mortons w/ White House officials.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$43.25	GTG000904-ACCT-SG
1/7/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.6		GTG003908-ACCT-CW
1/7/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.1		GTG002322-ACCT-CS
1/8/2002	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White House staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.6		GTG003909-ACCT-CW
1/8/2002	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with White House staff; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.2		GTG002323-ACCT-CS
1/10/2002	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House and Congressional staff.	Coushatta	1.2		GTG002323-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
1/15/2002	Todd Boulanger	Call to S. Ralston with Karl Rove's office regarding the Choctaw jail and setting up a 1/18 appointment with White House Inter-governmental Affairs Liaison Ruben Barrales to discuss same; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.0		GTG003911-ACCT-CW
1/23/2002	Shawn Vasell	Prepare materials for meeting on Hill regarding jail; [REDACTED] meet with WH Legislative Affairs staff regarding jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.3		GTG003914-ACCT-CW
1/25/2002	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with WH staff regarding jail and need for DOJ to release funding; review materials; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.7		GTG003916-ACCT-CW
1/26/2002	Padgett Wilson	Hosting staff for dinner reception at the Dubliner with White House, [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$264.58	GTG003925-ACCT-CW
1/26/2002	Padgett Wilson	Hosting staff for dinner reception at The Dubliner with White House, [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$264.58	GTG002338-ACCT-CS
1/26/2002	Padgett Wilson	Hosting staff for dinner reception at the Dubliner with White House [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa		\$264.58	GTG000880-ACCT-SG
1/28/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House intergovernmental affairs about tribal issues and client jail; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.5		GTG003917-ACCT-CW
1/28/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House intergovernmental affairs office regarding tribal issues and possible visit to client reservation; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.9		GTG000899-ACCT-SG
1/29/2002	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff, [REDACTED]; review appropriations materials; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG003918-ACCT-CW
1/29/2002	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting [REDACTED], White House Legislative Affairs staff [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.1		GTG002329-ACCT-CS
2/1/2002	Padgett Wilson	Lunch at Oval Room Restaurant with White House legislative staff	Choctaw		\$152.29	GTG003894-ACCT-CW
2/1/2002	Padgett Wilson	[REDACTED]; meet with White House legislative staff regarding upcoming Congressional session.	Chitimacha	0.5		GTG018328-ACCT-CM

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
2/1/2002	Padgett Wilson	[REDACTED]; meet with White House legislative staff regarding upcoming session and Campaign Finance legislation	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003874-ACCT-CW
2/1/2002	Padgett Wilson	[REDACTED]; meet with White House legislative staff regarding upcoming session and Campaign Finance legislation.	Coushatta	1.5		GTG002302-ACCT-CS
2/1/2002	Padgett Wilson	[REDACTED]; meet with White House legislative staff regarding upcoming session and Campaign Finance legislation.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000863-ACCT-SG
2/5/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff discussion with Appropriations staff regarding Choctaw projects; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.6		GTG003875-ACCT-CW
2/5/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff and discuss appropriations strategies and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.7		GTG002304-ACCT-CS
2/7/2002	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Sesto Senso with Office of Presidential Personnel staff	Choctaw		\$80.52	GTG003895-ACCT-CW
2/7/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG002305-ACCT-CS
2/14/2002	Shawn Vasell	Meals @ Cosi Sandwich Bar w' S. Ralston (White House)	Choctaw		\$26.85	GTG003856-ACCT-CW
2/21/2002	Neil Volz	Dinner at Shelly's Back Room with White House staff	Choctaw		\$300.00	GTG003857-ACCT-CW
3/7/2002	Padgett Wilson	Attend meeting with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Chitimacha	0.4		GTG018335-ACCT-CM
3/7/2002	Padgett Wilson	[REDACTED]; attend meeting with [REDACTED] House staff.	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001515-ACCT-CS
3/14/2002	Neil Volz	Dinner at Hawk & Dove with White House [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$300.00	GTG003864-ACCT-CW
3/14/2002	Jack Abramoff	Spoke with [REDACTED] White House official about client issues	Choctaw	2.8		GTG003845-ACCT-CW
3/15/2002	Kevin Ring	Meal at Cosi Sandwich with White House officials	Choctaw		\$6.93	GTG003865-ACCT-CW
3/18/2002	Kevin Ring	correspondence with White House official regarding issue; [REDACTED]	Sandia	2.9		GTG0005653-ACCT-S
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with White House Legislative and Policy staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$193.64	GTG003867-ACCT-CW
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with White House Legislative and Policy Staff; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa		\$193.64	GTG000828-ACCT-SG
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with White House Legislative and Policy staff.	Coushatta		\$193.65	GTG002268-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with White House Legislative and Policy staff; [REDACTED]	AIC - Malaysia		\$200.00	GTG-026482-ACCT-AIC
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Attend meeting with White House legislative and policy staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003849-ACCT-CW
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Attend meeting with White House legislative and policy staff; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.3		GTG001520-ACCT-CS
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Attend meeting with White House legislative and policy staff; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.3		GTG002288-ACCT-CS
3/21/2002	Padgett Wilson	Attend meeting with White House legislative and policy staff; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000850-ACCT-SG
3/27/2002	Jack Abramoff	Met with [REDACTED] White House staff to discuss client issues	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003851-ACCT-CW
3/29/2002	Michael Williams	[REDACTED]; conversation with B. Jackson (Bush White House) regarding Saginaw political activity.	Saginaw Chippewa	2.2		GTG000853-ACCT-SG
4/1/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding client issues; [REDACTED] meet with White House officials.	Choctaw	3.5		GTG003812-ACCT-CW
4/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House Intergovernmental Affairs staff regarding client issues, including Jena.	Coushatta	1.5		GTG002257-ACCT-CS
4/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding tribal issues and possible visit to client reservation.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000811-ACCT-SG
4/1/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with White House Intergovernmental affairs official regarding client issue; [REDACTED]	Sandia	2.0		GTG005659-ACCT-S
4/2/2002	Kevin Ring	Signatures with White House official.	Choctaw		\$35.15	GTG003829-ACCT-CW
4/2/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House officials regarding various client matters; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.9		GTG003812-ACCT-CW
4/2/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.0		GTG000811-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
4/2/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; phone conversation with White House official regarding intelligence from Interior Department [REDACTED]	Sandia	1.9		GTG005659-ACCT-S
4/4/2002	Neil Volz	Lunch at Signatures Restaurant with White House staff	Choctaw		\$93.00	GTG003829-ACCT-CW
4/4/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] correspondence with White House official; [REDACTED]	Sandia	1.0		GTG005660-ACCT-S
4/5/2002	Padgett Wilson	Meet with [REDACTED] A. Jones (WH Legislative), [REDACTED] regarding PM visit and future CODELs to Malaysia	AIC - Malaysia	5.3		GTG-026488-ACCT-AIC
4/5/2002	Padgett Wilson	Meet with [REDACTED] A. Jones (WH Legislative) regarding Senate schedule after recess and which legislation has possibility of movement	Choctaw	0.9		GTG003815-ACCT-CW
4/11/2002	Jack Abramoff	Met with White House officials and discussed client matters	Choctaw	2.5		GTG003817-ACCT-CW
4/15/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dickey's Frozen Custard w/White House Staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$10.24	GTG000795-ACCT-SG
4/15/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client matters.	Coushatta	0.7		GTG002260-ACCT-CS
4/15/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] correspondence with White House IGA.	Sandia	2.8		GTG005662-ACCT-S
4/16/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with White House intergovernmental affairs official regarding client matters.	Choctaw	3.5		GTG003819-ACCT-CW
4/22/2002	Todd Boulanger	[REDACTED] call to S. Ralston at WH to discuss photos; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	3.1		GTG000820-ACCT-SG
4/24/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; meet with WH Intergovernmental affairs regarding same.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000821-ACCT-SG
4/26/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; call to White House on same.	Choctaw	2.8		GTG003823-ACCT-CW
5/2/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with RNC, White House [REDACTED]	Sandia		\$32.59	GTG005674-ACCT-S
5/2/2002	Neil Volz	Lunch at Signatures with White House Staff.	Coushatta		\$77.00	GTG002249-ACCT-CS
5/2/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures Restaurant with [REDACTED] White House [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$97.75	GTG002249-ACCT-CS
5/2/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa		\$97.75	GTG000798-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
5/2/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures Restaurant with [REDACTED] White House, [REDACTED]	AIC - Malaysia		\$97.76	GTG-026508-ACCT-AIC
5/2/2002	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures Restaurant with [REDACTED] White House, [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$97.76	GTG003801-ACCT-CW
5/2/2002	Neil Voiz	Lunch with White House staff.	Coushatta	1.0		GTG002236-ACCT-CS
5/9/2002	Kevin Ring	Signatures w/White House Staff	Coushatta		\$31.68	GTG002250-ACCT-CS
5/9/2002	Tony Rudy	[REDACTED]; Discussion with M. Schlapp (White House) regarding jail project	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003790-ACCT-CW
5/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Signatures w/White House Staff	Coushatta		\$43.16	GTG002250-ACCT-CS
5/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Signatures w/ White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$43.17	GTG000800-ACCT-SG
5/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client matters, including SBA issue; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.5		GTG003791-ACCT-CW
5/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House Official regarding intergovernmental/tribal affairs position.	Coushatta	1.0		GTG002238-ACCT-CS
5/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client matters .	Saginaw Chippewa	1.0		GTG000786-ACCT-SG
5/15/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding client issues and potential WH forum; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003792-ACCT-CW
5/15/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) and client; follow up with J. Farley.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.7		GTG000788-ACCT-SG
5/21/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding client issues.	Choctaw	2.0		GTG003794-ACCT-CW
5/21/2002	Kevin Ring	Review with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding tribal matters and possible tour of client reservation.	Coushatta	0.8		GTG002241-ACCT-CS
5/21/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Affairs) regarding client matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.5		GTG000790-ACCT-SG
5/28/2002	Jack Abramoff	Met with White House officials and discussed client matters	Choctaw	2.5		GTG003795-ACCT-CW
6/12/2002	Tony Rudy	Dinner at Angelo & Maxie's with White House staffers	Choctaw		\$27.25	GTG003781-ACCT-CW
6/12/2002	Tony Rudy	Dinner at Angelo & Maxie's with White House staffers	Choctaw		\$357.51	GTG003781-ACCT-CW
6/18/2002	Jack Abramoff	Meet with White House officials to discuss client issues	Choctaw	2.5		GTG003770-ACCT-CW
6/19/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] call to White House intergovernmental affairs office.	Saginaw Chippewa	2.0		GTG000767-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
6/27/2002	Neil Volz	Meeting with staff contact in White House who works in political affairs office.	Howard Hills	2.0		GTG0026053-ACCT-HH
6/28/2002	Linsey Crisler	Lunch at Signatures with P. Watkins (White House).	Coushatta		\$145.55	GTG002208-ACCT-CS
7/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Morton's of Chicago with WH officials	Choctaw		\$40.71	GTG003753-ACCT-CW
7/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding general tribal issues.	Agua Caliente	1.0		GTG004293-ACCT-AC
7/1/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with White House official [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003730-ACCT-CW
7/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client and tribal issues.	Coushatta	1.0		GTG002192-ACCT-CS
7/2/2002	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House legislative staff regarding upcoming legislative schedule	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003732-ACCT-CW
7/5/2002	Jack Abramoff	Discuss client issues with White House officials	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003732-ACCT-CW
7/11/2002	Kevin Ring	Work related to project, including conversation with White House [REDACTED]	Sandia	1.9		GTG005682-ACCT-S
7/18/2002	Duane Gibson	Meeting with [REDACTED] White House staff on Koch roads concept; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente (moved to Koch for final bill)	4.0		GTG005338-ACCT-AC; GTG005332-ACCT-AC;
7/25/2002	Brigham Pierce	Dinner at Oval Room with White House	Coushatta		\$103.35	GTG002178-ACCT-CS
8/7/2002	Kevin Ring	Meal at Cosi Sandwich Bar with White House official	Agua Caliente		\$11.94	GTG004335-ACCT-AC
8/7/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with White House official regarding client matters	Choctaw	1.1		GTG003692-ACCT-CW
8/12/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding general tribal matters.	Coushatta	1.0		GTG002168-ACCT-CS
8/13/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; correspondence with WH official regarding tribal matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.7		GTG000624-ACCT-SG
9/11/2002	Jack Abramoff	Meet with White House official	Choctaw	3.0		GTG003712-ACCT-CW
9/13/2002	Jack Abramoff	Discuss client issues with White house officials	Choctaw	2.5		GTG003714-ACCT-CW
9/18/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] conversation with J. Farley (White House) regarding NiGC issue; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003717-ACCT-CW
10/2/2002	Jack Abramoff	Meet with senior White House staff to discuss client issue	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003650-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
10/10/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; conversation with White House about tribal issues, including reaffirmation of government-to-government relationship	Choctaw	3.9		GTG003656-ACCT-CW
10/10/2002	Kevin Ring	Work related to regional gaming matters, including conversations with White House officials.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000649-ACCT-SG
10/11/2002	Brigham Pierce	Lunch at Daily Grill with White House staffers	Choctaw		\$36.86	GTG003682-ACCT-CW
10/14/2002	Kevin Ring	Conversation with White House official regarding NIGC issues.	Coushatta	0.3		GTG002089-ACCT-CS
10/16/2002	Kevin Ring	Phone conversation with White House official regarding client visit.	Agua Caliente	0.3		GTG004392-ACCT-AC
10/16/2002	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.7		GTG003659-ACCT-CW
10/17/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding various client issues, including Chief Martin project and regional gaming matters; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003660-ACCT-CW
10/17/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House IGA) on various tribal matters.	Coushatta	0.5		GTG002091-ACCT-CS
10/17/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client and tribal matters; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.4		GTG000652-ACCT-SG
10/18/2002	Todd Boulanger	Meet with J. Farley (White House Intergovernmental Office) [REDACTED] regarding the Chief Martin project; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.3		GTG003660-ACCT-CW
10/21/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] follow-up with White House on Chief Martin issue; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.0		GTG003661-ACCT-CW
10/22/2002	Kevin Ring	Numerous calls and conversations with White House officials regarding Chief Martin project; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	4.2		GTG003662-ACCT-CW
10/24/2002	Michael Williams	Meetings with White House officials regarding Guam Judicial empowerment act.	Howard Hills	2.1		GTG026077-ACCT-HH
10/28/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] follow-up correspondence with White House regarding Chief Martin matter; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003666-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
10/30/2002	Linsey Crisler	██████████ participate in conference call with K. Rove (White House) and K. Mellman (sic) (White House) concerning political landscape; review daily clips and publications for Indian Affairs developments.	Agua Caliente	1.8		GTG004398-ACCT-AC
10/30/2002	Linsey Crisler	██████████ participate in conference call with K. Rove (White House) and K. Mehlman (White House) concerning political landscape; ██████████	Choctaw	1.9		GTG003667-ACCT-CW
10/30/2002	Linsey Crisler	██████████ participate in conference call with K. Rove (White House) and K. Mehlman (White House) concerning political landscape; ██████████	Coushatta	2.1		GTG002095-ACCT-CS
10/30/2002	Linsey Crisler	██████████ participate in conference call with K. Rove (White House) and K. Mehlman (White House) concerning political landscape; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	1.9		GTG000658-ACCT-SG
11/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Arrange for client to participate in White House call; participate in same	Agua Caliente	0.8		GTG004417-ACCT-AC
11/1/2002	Kevin Ring	Arrange for client to participate in White House call regarding Native American month; participate in same; ██████████	Choctaw	3.0		GTG003622-ACCT-CW
11/2/2002	Brigham Pierce	Dinner at Champs with White House/ ██████████	Choctaw		\$46.00	GTG003640-ACCT-CW
11/4/2002	Duane Gibson	Lunch at Signatures with White House Officials	Agua Caliente		\$32.64	GTG004412-ACCT-AC
11/4/2002	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Signature's with White House official	Choctaw		\$32.64	GTG003641-ACCT-CW
11/4/2002	Kevin Ring	██████████ meet with White House official regarding Chief Martin project.	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003623-ACCT-CW
11/5/2002	Kevin Ring	██████████ meet with White House and Interior Department official regarding various client matters, including Chief Martin project and client operations.	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003624-ACCT-CW
11/5/2002	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House and congressional contacts.	Choctaw	1.5		GTG003624-ACCT-CW
11/5/2002	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House ██████████ at ARMPAC event.	Coushatta	1.5		GTG002058-ACCT-CS
11/5/2002	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House ██████████ at ARMPAC event.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.5		GTG000595-ACCT-SG
11/20/2002	Jack Abramoff	Meet with White House staff on client issues	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003632-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
11/21/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] correspondence with team regarding trip to client reservation; work related to Chief Martin project, including calls to White House	Choctaw	2.8		GTG003634-ACCT-CW
11/22/2002	Kevin Ring	Correspondence with White House official regarding general client matters	Choctaw	0.3		GTG003634-ACCT-CW
11/26/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] calls to White House on Chief Martin project; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.1		GTG003636-ACCT-CW
12/2/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding general tribal matters.	Agua Caliente	0.4		GTG005236-ACCT-AC
12/2/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding diabetes signing ceremony and other client issues [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.8		GTG003599-ACCT-CW
12/2/2002	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) on general tribal matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	0.5		GTG000570-ACCT-SG
12/3/2002	Kevin Ring	Follow-up work on trip to client reservation; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003600-ACCT-CW
12/4/2002	Kevin Ring	Phone conversation with WH official regarding diabetes funding; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.3		GTG003601-ACCT-CW
12/5/2002	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] phone conversation with J. Farley (White House) regarding diabetes signing ceremony; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	5.6		GTG003601-ACCT-CW
12/6/2002	Todd Boulanger	Meet with M. Kirk (White House) and J. DeWitte (Camp) to discuss regional gaming matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	4.0		GTG000573-ACCT-SG
12/11/2002	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] lunch with White House staff.	Choctaw	2.0		GTG003605-ACCT-CW
12/11/2002	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House political affairs office.	Coushatta	1.5		GTG002029-ACCT-CS
12/12/2002	Neil Volz	Dinner at Hawk and Dove with White House Leadership staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$172.50	GTG000588-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
12/18/2002	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House staff.	Choctaw	1.2		GTG003589-ACCT-CW
12/18/2002	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House staff.	Coushatta	1.2		GTG002032-ACCT-CS
12/18/2002	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000541-ACCT-SG
1/2/2003	Jack Abramoff	Meet with White House Official to discuss client priorities	Choctaw	2.8		GTG003569-ACCT-CW
1/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED] White House staff	Choctaw		\$50.02	GTG003589-ACCT-CW
1/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding FY03 bill and FY04 President's budget	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003570-ACCT-CW
1/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding FY03 bills and news articles concerning Indian gaming; review LA gaming materials.	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001999-ACCT-CS
1/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding FY03 bills and news articles concerning Indian gaming; review Gun Lake materials.	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000542-ACCT-SG
1/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House legislative affairs staff to discuss Indian agenda for 108th Congress; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003571-ACCT-CW
1/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff to discuss appropriations and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.7		GTG001999-ACCT-CS
1/8/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations and tax bill	Agua Caliente	1.8		GTG004442-ACCT-AC
1/8/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] to discuss appropriations [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003573-ACCT-CW
1/8/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House [REDACTED] regarding appropriations; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG001410-ACCT-CS
1/9/2003	Brigham Pierce	Lunch at Cosi with White House Staff	Agua Caliente		\$12.10	GTG004464-ACCT-AC

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
1/19/2003	Jack Abramoff	Meet with White House staff to discuss client concerns	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003573-ACCT-CW
1/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	discussion with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding tax bill.	Chitimacha	1.1		GTG18394-ACCT-CM
1/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	discussion with White House Leg. Affairs regarding tax bill.	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003575-ACCT-CW
1/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	discussion with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding tax bill;	Coushatta	2.3		GTG001412-ACCT-CS
1/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at the Bombay Club with White House staff	Coushatta		\$105.67	GTG001978-ACCT-CS
1/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at signatures with White House staff	Choctaw		\$119.00	GTG003558-ACCT-CW
1/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding President's tax proposal; review materials.	Agua Caliente	1.4		GTG004445-ACCT-AC
1/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meet with S. Ralston (White House);	Choctaw	3.9		GTG003577-ACCT-CW
1/15/2003	Kevin Ring	phone conversation with WH official regarding Indian meeting at WH with President and Choctaw participation;	Choctaw	3.8		GTG003577-ACCT-CW
1/16/2003	Kevin Ring	meet with White House official regarding client issues;	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003578-ACCT-CW
1/17/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Bistro Bis White House Leg. Aff. Staff re. tribal issues	Coushatta		\$106.22	GTG001978-ACCT-CS
1/18/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Signatures with White House staff	Coushatta		\$50.02	GTG001978-ACCT-CS
1/18/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Signatures with White House staff	Choctaw		\$50.03	GTG003558-ACCT-CW
1/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Ten Penh with White House	Choctaw		\$105.30	GTG003558-ACCT-CW
1/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Ten Penh with White House	Choctaw		\$105.30	GTG003558-ACCT-CW
1/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Ten Penh with White House	Coushatta		\$105.30	GTG001979-ACCT-CS
1/22/2003	Neil Volz	lunch with White House staff at The Exchange	Choctaw		\$26.00	GTG003559-ACCT-CW
1/22/2003	Neil Volz	meet with White House staff to discuss Chief Martin project	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003582-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
1/23/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	2.1		GTG004450-ACCT-AC
1/23/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003583-ACCT-CW
1/23/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] White House [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.4		GTG000555-ACCT-SG
1/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at the Dubliner with White House Legal Affairs, Sununu office	Choctaw		\$43.00	GTG003559-ACCT-CW
1/24/2003	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House representatives	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003583-ACCT-CW
1/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003583-ACCT-CW
1/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG002012-ACCT-CS
1/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.3		GTG000556-ACCT-SG
1/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. staff [REDACTED]	Sandia	0.0		GTG005722-ACCT-S
1/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Sag. Chip.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000557-ACCT-SG
1/27/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House IGA) regarding client issues; [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.8		GTG003584-ACCT-CW
1/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Gun Lake; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000557-ACCT-SG
1/28/2003	Todd Boulanger	Attend State of the Union party with White House (C. Cox), [REDACTED]	Choctaw	0.5		GTG003585-ACCT-CW
1/28/2003	Todd Boulanger	Attend State of the Union party with White House (C. Cox), [REDACTED] [REDACTED] discuss general tribal matters with same.	Coushatta	0.4		GTG001422-ACCT-CS
1/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discuss Indian gaming with WH and Interior Dept. [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003586-ACCT-CW
1/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discuss Indian gaming with WH and Interior Dept. [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000559-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
2/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues and SIAC action; [REDACTED] meet with same and S. Vasell and T. Boulanger regarding same.	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003542-ACCT-CW
2/5/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff to discuss appropriations and Bush Administration agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.8		GTG001963-ACCT-CS
2/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	0.6		GTG000514-ACCT-SG
2/6/2003	Padgett Wilson	Beverages at Zola with White House [REDACTED] staff	Agua Caliente		\$55.20	GTG004468-ACCT-AC
2/6/2003	Padgett Wilson	Attend tax meeting with White House, [REDACTED] staff	Choctaw	1.1		GTG003544-ACCT-CW
2/6/2003	Padgett Wilson	Attend tax meeting with White House [REDACTED] staff.	Coushatta	1.1		GTG001964-ACCT-CS
2/6/2003	Padgett Wilson	Attend tax meeting with White House, [REDACTED] staff.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000516-ACCT-SG
2/11/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001966-ACCT-CS
2/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding IGRA and NIGC; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003547-ACCT-CW
2/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bombay Club with WH staff	Coushatta		\$84.13	GTG001983-ACCT-CS
2/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Ruth's Chris Steak House with [REDACTED] White House legislative staff, DOE staff, [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$116.39	GTG001983-ACCT-CS
2/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Ruth's Chris Steak House with [REDACTED] White House Legislative staff, DOE staff, [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$232.78	GTG003564-ACCT-CW
2/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding President's tax proposal; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000521-ACCT-SG
2/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Zola with White House staff [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa		\$80.93	GTG000536-ACCT-SG
2/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House Leg Affairs [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003549-ACCT-CW
2/18/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs staff	Choctaw		\$136.85	GTG003564-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
2/18/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with Indian Affairs staff regarding IGRA and NIGC	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001969-ACCT-CS
2/18/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House Leg. Affairs director regarding Sag. Chip. And IGRA; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000523-ACCT-SG
2/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding Indian Gaming and NIGC; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003552-ACCT-CW
2/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding Indian gaming and NIGC; [REDACTED] meeting with Dept. of Energy staff regarding tribal energy programs; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.2		GTG001971-ACCT-CS
2/22/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED]; Department of Treasury staff; White House policy and legislative staff	Agua Caliente		\$215.30	GTG004471-ACCT-AC
2/22/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] Department of Treasury staff, White House policy and Legislative staff	Choctaw		\$215.30	GTG003535-ACCT-CW
2/22/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] Treasury staff, and WH Policy and Leg staff	Coushatta		\$215.30	GTG001984-ACCT-CS
2/22/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED]; Department of Treasury staff; White House policy and legislative staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$215.30	GTG000537-ACCT-SG
2/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner meeting with [REDACTED] White House legislative affairs staff and House Judiciary staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003553-ACCT-CW
2/27/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding updates on client issues; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003555-ACCT-CW
3/1/2003	Padgett Wilson	Beverages at Off the Record with White House policy staff.	Agua Caliente		\$38.90	GTG004549-ACCT-AC
3/1/2003	Kevin Ring	Beverages at Signatures with White House staff on 3/1/03	Choctaw		\$56.40	GTG003491-ACCT-CW
3/4/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding invitation to visit client reservation and client issues; [REDACTED] meet with House.	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003515-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding FY04 President's budget and Indian gaming.	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003515-ACCT-CW
3/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Indian gaming; ██████████	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001928-ACCT-CS
3/4/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.1		GTG000482-ACCT-SG
3/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meeting with White House Leg. Affairs staff regarding tax bill and Indian gaming; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000482-ACCT-SG
3/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Morton's of Chicago with White House official.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$32.66	GTG000464-ACCT-SG
3/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Morton's of Chicago with White House official on 3/5/03	Choctaw		\$32.67	GTG003493-ACCT-CW
3/5/2003	Kevin Ring	██████████ meet with White House official regarding IGA office and client issues; ██████████	Choctaw	3.7		GTG003516-ACCT-CW
3/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with S. Ralston (White House) regarding client matters.	Coushatta	0.7		GTG001929-ACCT-CS
3/5/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff to discuss tax bill; ██████████	Coushatta	1.7		GTG001929-ACCT-CS
3/5/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with S. Ralston (White House) regarding IGA office and client issues; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	0.9		GTG000483-ACCT-SG
3/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner & beverages at TenPenh with White House, ██████████ Department of Commerce, House ██████████ staff	Agua Caliente		\$91.58	GTG004549-ACCT-AC
3/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Ten Penh with White House, ██████████ Department of Commerce, House ██████████ staff on 3/6/03	Choctaw		\$91.58	GTG003493-ACCT-CW
3/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Ten Penh with WH, ██████████ Dept of Commerce, House ██████████ staff.	Coushatta		\$91.58	GTG001917-ACCT-CS
3/7/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House ██████████ regarding tax bill; ██████████	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003518-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/7/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting regarding tax bill with [REDACTED] White House, [REDACTED] staff, [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG001931-ACCT-CS
3/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with WH staff at Bistro Bis.	Coushatta		\$51.52	GTG001917-ACCT-CS
3/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Bistro Bis with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$51.53	GTG000466-ACCT-SG
3/11/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$39.08	GTG000466-ACCT-SG
3/11/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$646.28	GTG000466-ACCT-SG
3/12/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss Presidential Medal of Freedom with White House staff.	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003521-ACCT-CW
3/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House staff regarding President's tax proposal review land in trust materials; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	1.4		GTG004510-ACCT-AC
3/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with S. Ralston (White House); [REDACTED]	Choctaw	3.9		GTG003522-ACCT-CW
3/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with S. Ralston (White House); [REDACTED]	Coushatta	3.1		GTG001935-ACCT-CS
3/14/2003	Todd Boulanger	Breakfast at Old Ebbitt Grill with White House staff	Agua Caliente		\$31.75	GTG004550-ACCT-AC
3/14/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meet with White House staff to discuss pending client matters [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.3		GTG003522-ACCT-CW
3/14/2003	Todd Boulanger	Met White House staff re. client matters; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.2		GTG001935-ACCT-CS
3/14/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meet with White House staff to discuss pending client matters; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000489-ACCT-SG
3/15/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at La Loma with [REDACTED] White House legislative staff on 3/15/03.	Choctaw		\$100.00	GTG003498-ACCT-CW
3/16/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Tune Inn with [REDACTED] White House Legislative staff	Agua Caliente		\$67.00	GTG004551-ACCT-AC
3/17/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with White House staff, regarding Choctaw [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003524-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/17/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with White House leg. Affairs staff; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000491-ACCT-SG
3/20/2003	Neil Voiz	Meet with White House officials regarding Senate IGRA hearings.	Choctaw	0.8		GTG003526-ACCT-CW
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Lounge 21 with [REDACTED] WH staff.	Coushatta		\$77.93	GTG001918-ACCT-CS
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Lounge 21 with [REDACTED] White House staff on 3/21/03	Choctaw		\$77.94	GTG003500-ACCT-CW
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner & beverages at Lounge 21 with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$77.94	GTG000470-ACCT-SG
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding client issues; NIGC research;	Agua Caliente	2.1		GTG004515-ACCT-AC
3/21/2003	Brigham Pierce	Meeting with White House staff [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003527-ACCT-CW
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs staff, [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003527-ACCT-CW
3/21/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] White House, Legislative Affairs staff, [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.8		GTG000494-ACCT-SG
3/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff staff regarding budget and tax bills; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	1.2		GTG004516-ACCT-AC
3/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with WH Leg Aff. Staff regarding budget and tax bills; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003529-ACCT-CW
3/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding budget and tax bills; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG001942-ACCT-CS
3/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding budget and tax bills; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.3		GTG000495-ACCT-SG
3/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with Interior Department staff regarding tribal issues; [REDACTED] discussion with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Sag. Chip.	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000496-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
3/27/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch with White House official at Morton's of Chicago on 3/27/03	Choctaw		\$46.69	GTG003502-ACCT-CW
3/27/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch with White House official at Morton's of Chicago.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$46.69	GTG000259-ACCT-SG
3/27/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client and tribal issues.	Agua Caliente	0.8		GTG004534-ACCT-AC
3/27/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client matters.	Choctaw	3.2		GTG003530-ACCT-CW
3/27/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED]; meet wit J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.4		GTG000497-ACCT-SG
3/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with OMB and WH Leg. Affairs staff regarding budget and tax bill.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000497-ACCT-SG
3/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House staff regarding supplemental; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003531-ACCT-CW
3/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House staff regarding supplemental; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001376-ACCT-CS
3/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House staff regarding supplemental; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000498-ACCT-SG
3/31/2003	Brigham Pierce	Lunch with New Intern/White House staff	Agua Caliente		\$44.50	GTG004553-ACCT-AC
4/1/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] conversation with WH official regarding client issues; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003474-ACCT-CW
4/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Bistro Bis with White House staff [REDACTED] US Commerce staff on 4/2/03	Choctaw		\$91.04	GTG003504-ACCT-CW
4/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner & beverages at Bistro Bis with White House staff [REDACTED] US Commerce staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$91.04	GTG000472-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
4/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg. Aff staff regarding tax legislation and offsets;	Agua Caliente	2.6		GTG004537-ACCT-AC
4/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg. Aff. staff regarding tax legislation and offsets;	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003475-ACCT-CW
4/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding tax legislation and offsets;	Saginaw Chippewa	2.2		GTG000450-ACCT-SG
4/3/2003	Padgett Wilson	Beverages at Off the Record with White House policy staff.	Agua Caliente		\$24.35	GTG004554-ACCT-AC
4/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Bistro Bis with White House staff	Saginaw Chippewa		\$68.02	GTG000472-ACCT-SG
4/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with White House staff	Agua Caliente		\$68.03	GTG005059-ACCT-AC
4/4/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House Legislative and Policy staff regarding Administration legislative priorities.	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003477-ACCT-CW
4/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	review Choctaw agenda with House Leadership staff; dinner with White House Leg. Aff. staff	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003477-ACCT-CW
4/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Indian gaming;	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001906-ACCT-CS
4/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	review Sag. Chip. Agenda with House Leadership staff; dinner with White House Leg. Aff. staff;	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000452-ACCT-SG
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at the Oval Room with White House official on 4/11/03	Choctaw		\$24.02	GTG003506-ACCT-CW
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at the Oval Room with White House official.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$24.02	GTG000439-ACCT-SG
4/11/2003	Brigham Pierce	meet with White House staff	Agua Caliente	1.6		GTG004541-ACCT-AC
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding general tribal matters.	Agua Caliente	0.5		GTG004541-ACCT-AC

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
4/11/2003	Brigham Pierce	[REDACTED] meet with White House staff	Choctaw	1.2		GTG003481-ACCT-CW
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding various client issues.	Choctaw	3.6		GTG003481-ACCT-CW
4/11/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussions with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding Budget and tax bill; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003481-ACCT-CW
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with Jennifer Farley (WH) regarding tribal matters.	Coushatta	0.5		GTG001909-ACCT-CS
4/11/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussions with White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Budget and tax bill; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.3		GTG001909-ACCT-CS
4/11/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding general tribal matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	0.5		GTG000454-ACCT-SG
4/11/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussions with White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Budget and tax bill; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.9		GTG000455-ACCT-SG
4/14/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House staff.	Choctaw	0.9		GTG003482-ACCT-CW
4/15/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with A. Jones (WH Legislative office) regarding timing of President's growth package; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	3.8		GTG004543-ACCT-AC
4/16/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with White House staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003483-ACCT-CW
4/16/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner with White House Leg. Affairs staff; discussion with T. Boulanger; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000457-ACCT-SG
4/17/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] WH Legislative staff.	Coushatta		\$214.43	GTG001893-ACCT-CS
4/17/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House Legislative staff	Agua Caliente		\$214.44	GTG004556-ACCT-AC
4/17/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House Legislative staff on 4/17/03	Choctaw		\$214.44	GTG003508-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
4/17/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House Legislative staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$214.44	GTG000440-ACCT-SG
4/17/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss client priorities with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000457-ACCT-SG
4/18/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] call to White House; [REDACTED]	Sandia	1.6		GTG005743-ACCT-S
4/21/2003	Stephanie Leger Short	Attend event at WH [REDACTED]	Coushatta	5.3		GTG001912-ACCT-CS
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Signatures Restaurant with White House Political Director	Agua Caliente		\$61.02	GTG004617-ACCT-AC
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast at the Willard Room Policy with WH Leg Aff staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$113.41	GTG000261-ACCT-SG
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast at the Willard Room Policy with WH Leg Aff staff.	Coushatta		\$113.42	GTG001894-ACCT-CS
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast at the Willard Room Policy with WH Leg. Aff. Staff on 4-22-03	Choctaw		\$117.02	GTG003509-ACCT-CW
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with White House Legislative Affairs policy staff; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	2.1		GTG004545-ACCT-AC
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with White House Legislative Affairs policy staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003485-ACCT-CW
4/22/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with White House Legislative Affairs policy staff; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.8		GTG000459-ACCT-SG
4/25/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with [REDACTED] regarding tribal issues; meet with J. Kelly (White House) regarding same	Choctaw	1.7		GTG003487-ACCT-CW
4/25/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House staff	Choctaw	1.3		GTG003487-ACCT-CW
4/25/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss tribal priorities with White House staff	Coushatta	1.2		GTG001915-ACCT-CS
4/25/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss client issues with White House staff [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	3.2		GTG000460-ACCT-SG
4/28/2003	Shawn Vasell	Conference call with White House staff regarding tax bill offsets; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	1.4		GTG004548-ACCT-AC

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
4/28/2003	Shawn Vasell	Conference call with White House staff regarding tax bill offsets; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003488-ACCT-CW
4/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussions with White House staff regarding the same.	Agua Caliente	1.6		GTG004575-ACCT-AC
4/29/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussions with White House staff regarding same.	Choctaw	1.9		GTG003489-ACCT-CW
4/30/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff [REDACTED] regarding tax bill and offsets.	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003489-ACCT-CW
4/30/2003	Shawn Vasell	Work on school cost share letter; [REDACTED] discussion with T. Boulanger regarding the same; meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff and [REDACTED] regarding tax bill and offsets.	Saginaw Chippewa	2.7		GTG000426-ACCT-SG
5/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.4		GTG003445-ACCT-CW
5/1/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meeting with WH Leg Affairs re: tax bill; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.8		GTG001879-ACCT-CS
5/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with WH Leg Affairs re: tax bill; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.8		GTG001880-ACCT-CS
5/7/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding tax legislation and White house end game strategy; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003448-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
5/8/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch meeting with White House staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.4		GTG003448-ACCT-CW
5/8/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch meeting with White House staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.6		GTG001882-ACCT-CS
5/9/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] Follow up with White House staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003449-ACCT-CW
5/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] follow-up with White House staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000430-ACCT-SG
5/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding Senate floor strategy on tax bill; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003452-ACCT-CW
5/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding Senate floor strategy on tax bill; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000432-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
5/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED] White House Legislative Affairs, [REDACTED] Vice President Cheney staff.	Coushatta		\$246.14	GTG001862-ACCT-CS
5/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff and VP Cheney staff regarding DOI; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001886-ACCT-CS
5/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with Senate Leadership and WH Leg Aff staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000433-ACCT-SG
5/16/2003	Padgett Wilson	Beverages at Off the Record with White House policy staff.	Agua Caliente		\$78.64	GTG004565-ACCT-AC
5/16/2003	Padgett Wilson	Dinner at Bobby Van's Steakhouse with White House policy [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente		\$222.93	GTG004565-ACCT-AC
5/16/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House [REDACTED] staff regarding client issues.	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003453-ACCT-CW
5/21/2003	Brigham Pierce	Lunch with White House staff at Au Bon Pain on 5/21/03	Choctaw		\$8.99	GTG003469-ACCT-CW
5/23/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with [REDACTED] White House [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.0		GTG000436-ACCT-SG
5/23/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff; meeting T. Boulanger [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000436-ACCT-SG
5/28/2003	Todd Boulanger	Work on scheduling matters with R. Christie, with the Executive Office of the Vice President to discuss client matters.	Choctaw	1.1		GTG003458-ACCT-CW
5/28/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with WH Leg. Aff. staff regarding Gun Lake and Indian gaming issues; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.6		GTG000436-ACCT-SG
5/29/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss client priorities with White House staff	Unisys	1.1		GTG026133-ACCT-UNI
6/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] calls to White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding tax legislation; meeting with DOL Asst. Sec regarding unionization issues; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	1.4		GTG005013-ACCT-AC
6/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] calls to White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding tax legislation; meeting with DOI, Asst. Sec. regarding unionization issues; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003416-ACCT-CW
6/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meet with WH Leg Affairs staff regarding tax legislation [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001849-ACCT-CS
6/3/2003	Padgett	Lunch at Oval Room Restaurant with White House Legislative staff	Agua		\$110.35	GTG004617-ACCT-AC

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
	Wilson		Caliente			
6/4/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with client [REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding visit with client and tribal issues generally	Agua Caliente	1.7		GTG005016-ACCT-AC
6/4/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding same.	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003417-ACCT-CW
6/4/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with WH intergovernmental affairs staff regarding tribal issues	Coushatta	0.7		GTG001850-ACCT-CS
6/5/2003	Padgett Wilson	Lunch at the Oval Room Restaurant with White House Legislative staff	Agua Caliente		\$110.35	GTG004999-ACCT-AC
6/5/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House and [REDACTED] staff on 6/5/03	Sandia		\$191.16	GTG005758-ACCT-S
6/5/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House [REDACTED] staff.	Coushatta		\$191.17	GTG001864-ACCT-CS
6/5/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss client priorities with White House staff	Choctaw	1.2		GTG003418-ACCT-CW
6/5/2003	Neil Volz	discuss client priorities with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000206-ACCT-SG
6/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs, GOP Activists, [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$147.15	GTG001864-ACCT-CS
6/7/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner and beverages at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House Staff	Agua Caliente		\$807.11	GTG004603-ACCT-AC
6/7/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner & beverages at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Coushatta		\$807.11	GTG001865-ACCT-CS
6/7/2003	Todd Boulanger	Dinner and beverages at Signatures with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$807.11	GTG000229-ACCT-SG
6/10/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff.	Chitimacha	1.7		GTG18427-ACCT-CM
6/12/2003	Padgett Wilson	Lunch at Bombay Club with White House Legislative staff on 6-12-03	Choctaw		\$65.95	GTG003436-ACCT-CW
6/12/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House legislative staff regarding legislative priorities leading up to and following the July 4th recess.	Choctaw	1.6		GTG003423-ACCT-CW
6/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	The Dubliner with White House Legislative Affairs staff	Agua Caliente		\$44.00	GTG004617-ACCT-AC
6/13/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Signatures with White House official on 6/13/03.	Choctaw		\$44.49	GTG003437-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
6/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding agenda; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.1		GTG001854-ACCT-CS
6/13/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with [REDACTED] regarding GOP Indian agenda; meet with WH official regarding general tribal matters.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000212-ACCT-SG
6/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff regarding agenda; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000212-ACCT-SG
6/16/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding DOI; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001855-ACCT-CS
6/16/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with [REDACTED] WH Leg. Aff. staff regarding tax bill; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000213-ACCT-SG
6/17/2003	Brigham Pierce	Lunch at Park Place with White House staff; Date 6/17/03.	Choctaw		\$13.30	GTG003437-ACCT-CW
6/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House legislative affairs staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.7		GTG003429-ACCT-CW
6/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001858-ACCT-CS
6/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with House leadership staff regarding Jena issue; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.6		GTG001858-ACCT-CS
6/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Lunch meeting with Bush campaign staff; review materials.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.6		GTG000222-ACCT-SG
6/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Biddy Mulligans with [REDACTED] White House Legal Affairs Staff	Coushatta		\$78.77	GTG001836-ACCT-CS
6/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Biddy Mulligans with [REDACTED] White House Legal Affairs staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$78.78	GTG000192-ACCT-SG
6/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg Aff. Staff regarding the same; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	2.1		GTG005034-ACCT-AC
6/27/2003	Kevin Ring	Phone conversation with WH official about possible board replacement for Chief; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	0.5		GTG000222-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
6/30/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ Meet with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding appropriations and agenda; ██████████	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001860-ACCT-CS
6/30/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meeting with WH Leg. Aff. staff regarding appropriations and agenda; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000223-ACCT-SG
7/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Tabard Inn Restaurant with ██████████ White House Legal Affairs ██████████	Choctaw		\$113.33	GTG003401-ACCT-CW
7/1/2003	Kevin Ring	██████████ calls to White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding tax legislation; meeting with DOL regarding unionization issue; ██████████	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003384-ACCT-CW
7/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with S. Ralston (Bush-Cheney 2004); review appropriations materials; ██████████	Choctaw	1.7		GTG003385-ACCT-CW
7/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000169-ACCT-SG
7/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meet with S. Ralston with White House to discuss same; CIRI Amendment	Choctaw	2.9		GTG003391-ACCT-CW
7/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with S. Ralston (Bush-Cheney 2004); ██████████	Coushatta	1.4		GTG001822-ACCT-CS
7/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with S. Ralston (Bush Cheney 2004); ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000170-ACCT-SG
7/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at Lounge 201 with ██████████ Department of Justice staff, VP Cheney staff on 7/3/03	Choctaw		\$55.35	GTG003402-ACCT-CW
7/3/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House Legislative staff ██████████ staff regarding legislative calendar leading up to August recess.	Coushatta	2.2		GTG001164-ACCT-CS
7/3/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House Legislative staff ██████████ regarding legislative calendar leading up to the August recess.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.5		GTG000171-ACCT-SG
7/16/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meet with White House Legislative staff regarding legislative schedule before August recess.	Choctaw	1.2		GTG003393-ACCT-CW
7/16/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meet with S. Ralston with White House to discuss client priorities; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	4.9		GTG000178-ACCT-SG
7/17/2003	Kevin Ring	Dinner at Signatures with White House officials on 7/17/03	Choctaw		\$38.03	GTG003407-ACCT-CW
7/17/2003	Padgett Wilson	Beverages at Signatures with White House staff ██████████ and Interior Approps staff	Agua Caliente		\$246.91	GTG004668-ACCT-AC

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
7/17/2003	Shawn Vasell	Work on Chitimacha T-3 requests; breakfast meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff.	Chitimacha	1.7		GTG18433-ACCT-CM
7/18/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House official regarding client issues [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003393-ACCT-CW
7/21/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] lunch with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003396-ACCT-CW
7/21/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	0.5		GTG000181-ACCT-SG
7/23/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding DOI; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.4		GTG001175-ACCT-CS
7/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Ten Penh with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Choctaw		\$111.98	GTG003409-ACCT-CW
7/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	Dinner at Ten Penh with [REDACTED] White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$111.98	GTG000158-ACCT-SG
7/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch with White House Leg. Aff. staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003396-ACCT-CW
7/30/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Bobby Van's Steakhouse with White House official on 7/30/2003	Choctaw		\$40.05	GTG003411-ACCT-CW
7/30/2003	Kevin Ring	Lunch at Bobby Van's steakhouse with White House official.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$40.05	GTG000159-ACCT-SG
7/30/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues	Agua Caliente	0.4		GTG004624-ACCT-AC
7/30/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding client issues.	Choctaw	1.9		GTG003397-ACCT-CW
7/30/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (white House) regarding client issues and upcoming client visit; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	0.7		GTG000187-ACCT-SG
8/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Beverages at McCormick & Schmick's with White House Legislative [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$128.35	GTG003380-ACCT-CW
8/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bobby Van's Steakhouse with White House Legislative Affairs for event	Agua Caliente		\$227.75	GTG004640-ACCT-AC
8/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bobby Van's steakhouse with White House Legislative Affairs for event.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$227.75	GTG000159-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
8/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Breakfast meeting with White House official [REDACTED]	Choctaw	1.7		GTG003367-ACCT-CW
8/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	End of session event with White House Leg. Aff. Staff [REDACTED] Secretary of Commerce Evans staff, [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.3		GTG000139-ACCT-SG
8/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with White House Leg. Aff. staff.	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003368-ACCT-CW
8/5/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; review materials.	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003375-ACCT-CW
8/18/2003	Padgett Wilson	Lunch at Signatures with White House Legislative, DOT, [REDACTED]	Choctaw		\$240.20	GTG003381-ACCT-CW
8/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bobby Van's steakhouse with White House Legislative Affairs for event.	Choctaw		\$227.75	GTG003378-ACCT-CW
8/25/2003	Padgett Wilson	Meet with White House legislative affairs official [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.0		GTG003384-ACCT-CW
8/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] lunch with White House Leg. Aff. Staff;	Saginaw Chippewa	2.2		GTG0000153-ACCT-SG
8/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Leg Affair [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente		\$89.63	GTG004688-ACCT-AC
8/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Leg Affair [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa		\$89.63	GTG000089-ACCT-SG
8/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Leg. Affairs [REDACTED]	Coushatta		\$103.60	GTG001787-ACCT-CS
9/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding Administration position on Shelby legislation; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.1		GTG023584-ACCT-IIA
9/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] send materials and emails to WH Leg. Aff. Staff; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.1		GTG023585-ACCT-IIA
9/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.6		GTG023585-ACCT-IIA
9/5/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] calls to White House Leg. Aff. Regarding the same; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.4		GTG023585-ACCT-IIA

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
9/5/2003	Kevin Ring	correspondence with J. Farley (White House) and S. Vasell regarding upcoming client visit.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000399-ACCT-SG
9/10/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client and general tribal issues	Choctaw	3.3		GTG005873/3353-ACCT-CW
9/10/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) and client.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.0		GTG000401-ACCT-SG
9/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Leg. Aff. staff	Saginaw Chippewa		\$53.00	GTG000091-ACCT-SG
9/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Leg Affairs staff	Agua Caliente		\$75.07	GTG004690-ACCT-AC
9/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with WH Leg. Aff. staff	Choctaw	1.2		GTG005875/3355-ACCT-CW
9/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with WH Leg. Aff. staff	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.1		GTG023586-ACCT-IIA
9/13/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with WH Leg. Aff. staff	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG000402-ACCT-SG
9/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff;	Choctaw	2.3		GTG00 5875/3355-ACCT-CW
9/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff	Coushatta	2.6		GTG001778-ACCT-CS
9/15/2003	Shawn Vasell	meeting with WH Leg Aff staff	Saginaw Chippewa	1.4		GTG000402-ACCT-SG
9/18/2003	Kevin Ring	Work on client issues, including meeting with White House official to review general tribal climate on issues and Chief Martin project.	Choctaw	3.2		GTG00 5877/ 3357-ACCT-CW
9/18/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with J. Farley (White House) regarding general tribal matters.	Coushatta	0.8		GTG001779-ACCT-CS
9/18/2003	Kevin Ring	Meet with White House official regarding client issues	Saginaw Chippewa	1.4		GTG000403-ACCT-SG
9/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Biddy Mulligans with White House legislative affairs staff	Choctaw		\$13.00	GTG003342-ACCT-CW
9/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$92.41	GTG000095-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
9/26/2003	Shawn Vasell	The Dubliner with White House Legislative Affairs.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$59.85	GTG0095-ACCT-SG
9/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	Renaissance Mayflower Hotel - Town & Country with White House Staff	Agua Caliente		\$84.79	GTG004692-ACCT-AC
9/29/2003	Brigham Pierce	Dinner at Agua Ardiente with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$58.00	GTG0095-ACCT-SG
9/29/2003	Brigham Pierce	██████████ meet with White House staff ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	3.9		GTG000407-ACCT-SG
10/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	The Bombay Club with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$64.08	GTG000096-ACCT-SG
10/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ meeting with S. Ralston (Bush-Cheney) ██████████	Agua Caliente	2.2		GTG004877-ACCT-AC
10/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Discussion with key White House staff regarding client issues.	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003328-ACCT-CW
10/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Leg Affairs staff ██████████ meeting with S. Ralston (Bush-Cheney) ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	1.8		GTG000065-ACCT-SG
10/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at the Dubliner with White House Legislative Affairs.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$35.00	GTG000097-ACCT-SG
10/4/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis w/ White House Leg. Aff. staff.	Choctaw		\$75.84	GTG003345-ACCT-CW
10/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ discussion with White House Leg. Aff. Staff regarding clients issues ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000072-ACCT-SG; GTG000073-ACCT-SG
10/17/2003	Shawn Vasell	Business lunch with WH Leg Aff Staff	Agua Caliente		\$37.75	GTG004700-ACCT-AC
10/17/2003	Neil Volz	Dinner meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding agenda.	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003329-ACCT-CW
10/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ lunch with White House Leg Aff. Staff ██████████	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003332-ACCT-CW
10/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	End of session event with White House Leg. Aff. Staff ██████████	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003367-ACCT-CW
10/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Morton's with White House official.	Choctaw		\$29.16	GTG003316-ACCT-CW
10/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	meal with ██████████ and WH Leg Affairs staff at the Dubliner.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$125.00	GTG000014-ACCT-SG
10/27/2003	Brigham	lunch at Baja Fresh with White House staff.	Coushatta		\$7.30	GTG001055-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
	Pierce					
10/27/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; meeting with White House Leg. Aff. [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.2		GTG003334-ACCT-CW
10/31/2003	Shawn Vasell	Bistro Bis with [REDACTED] / White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Choctaw		\$92.42	GTG003338-ACCT-CW
10/31/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Aff.: [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.1		GTG000085-ACCT-SG
11/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	Lunch meeting with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	2.2		GTG004706-ACCT-AC
11/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meet with White House official regarding tribal matters; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.5		GTG003298-ACCT-CW
11/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	lunch meeting with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	1.8		GTG000371-ACCT-SG
11/5/2003	Kevin Ring	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding agenda; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003301-ACCT-CW
11/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Olives with White House staff.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$74.05	GTG000386-ACCT-SG
11/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	meal at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED], DoT, [REDACTED], White House Legislative Affairs Staff	Coushatta		\$155.25	GTG001679-ACCT-CS
11/6/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] discussion with White House Leg Aff staff regarding clients issues; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.6		GTG000373-ACCT-SG
11/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with WH Leg. Aff. Staff;	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003305-ACCT-CW
11/12/2003	Neil Volz	Discuss client issue with White House staff.	Intl Interactive Alliance	1.6		GTG023609-ACCT-IIA
11/12/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED] meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding agenda; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000375-ACCT-SG
11/13/2003	Kevin Ring	meal at Morton's with White House official	Coushatta		\$29.16	GTG001680-ACCT-CS

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
11/13/2003	Kevin Ring	meal at Morton's with White House official.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$29.17	GTG000016-ACCT-SG
11/13/2003	Kevin Ring	██████████; meeting with S. Ralston (Bush-Cheney); ██████████	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003322-ACCT-CW
11/13/2003	Kevin Ring	meet with White House official regarding client issues.	Saginaw Chippewa	1.2		GTG0000376-ACCT-SG
11/13/2003	Kevin Ring	meet with White House official	Sandia	1.1		GTG005787-ACCT-S
11/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	meal at Bobby Van's with ██████████, WH Leg Affairs staff, and ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa		\$119.69	GTG000017-ACCT-SG
11/14/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event at Signature's restaurant for White House Legislative Affairs office.	Choctaw		\$199.43	GTG003287-ACCT-CW
11/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	meal at Ireland's Four Courts with White House Legislative Affairs staff	Coushatta		\$32.50	GTG001682-ACCT-CS
11/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ dinner meeting with WH Leg Aff. Staff; ██████████	Agua Caliente	1.4		GTG004712-ACCT-AC
11/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with White House Legislative Affairs office; ██████████	Choctaw	1.1		GTG003307-ACCT-CW
11/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ dinner with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding mutual funds issue; ██████████	DH2	2.4		GTG026015-ACCT-DH2
11/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████ dinner meeting with WH Leg Aff staff; ██████████	Saginaw Chippewa	1.8		GTG000379-ACCT-SG
11/24/2003	Shawn Vasell	██████████; discussions with White House policy staff regarding SEC and mutual fund regulations; ██████████	DH2	2.7		GTG026017-ACCT-DH2
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with ██████████ staff, DOE staff, ██████████ staff and White House Legislative Affairs.	Choctaw		\$83.67	GTG003288-ACCT-CW
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at the Dubliner with ██████████ staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Choctaw		\$125.00	GTG003311-ACCT-CW
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	event for WH Leg Affairs staff at Signatures.	Saginaw Chippewa		\$199.43	GTG000021-ACCT-SG

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event at Signatures for White House Legislative Affairs Office	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$199.44	GTG023620-ACCT-IIA
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with White House Legislative Affairs office; [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	1.6		GTG004714-ACCT-AC
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	event with White House Leg. Affairs office; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	1.3		GTG001670-ACCT-CS
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with White House Legislative Affairs office; [REDACTED]	DH2	2.2		GTG026017-ACCT-DH2
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with White House Legislative Affairs office; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.3		GTG023610-ACCT-IIA
11/25/2003	Shawn Vasell	Event with WH Leg Affairs office; [REDACTED]	Saginaw Chippewa	2.4		GTG000382-ACCT-SG
12/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs.	Choctaw		\$83.58	GTG003288-ACCT-CW
12/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED] staff, DOE staff, [REDACTED] staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$83.63	GTG023620-ACCT-IIA
12/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED]	Agua Caliente	2.2		GTG004805-ACCT-AC
12/1/2003	Shawn Vasell	[REDACTED]; attend Cheney reception; discuss general tribal matters with VP staff.	Choctaw	1.8		GTG003280-ACCT-CW
12/2/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding SEC actions and mutual funds legislation; [REDACTED]	DH2	303.0		GTG026022-ACCT-DH2
12/3/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meals at Le Bateau Ivre in New York with White House Legislative Affairs staff & Senate Appropriations staff.	Choctaw		\$162.78	GTG003293-ACCT-CW
12/9/2003	Todd Boulanger	Meal at Bobby Van's with [REDACTED]'s staff, White House Legislative Affairs staff and Senate Appropriations staff.	Choctaw		\$119.69	GTG003285-ACCT-CW
12/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meal with White House staff at the Oval Room.	Choctaw		\$152.72	GTG003294-ACCT-CW
12/19/2003	Shawn Vasell	Meals at Le Bateau Ivre in New York with White House Legislative Affairs staff & Senate Appropriations staff.	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$162.78	GTG023621-ACCT-IIA

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
12/30/2003	Padgett Wilson	Lunch meeting with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003297-ACCT-CW
1/6/2004	Shawn Vasell	Discussion with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED] meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; review materials.	Agua Caliente	2.2		GTG004772-ACCT-AC
1/6/2004	Shawn Vasell	Discussion with S. Ralston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect); [REDACTED]; meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003253-ACCT-CW
1/6/2004	Shawn Vasell	Attend [REDACTED] /White House meeting to gather intelligence on Senate schedule; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.7		GTG003255-ACCT-CW
1/7/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with White House Legislative Affairs staff regarding SEC actions and mutual funds; [REDACTED]	DH2	3.3		GTG026032-ACCT-DH2
1/12/2004	Brigham Pierce	Meal at The Dubliner with White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Choctaw		\$36.00	GTG003268-ACCT-CW
1/13/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED]'s staff and White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Choctaw		\$55.82	GTG003270-ACCT-CW
1/13/2004	Todd Boulanger	[REDACTED] dinner meeting with White House Leg. Aff. Staff, [REDACTED] staff; review materials; [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.3		GTG003261-ACCT-CW
1/13/2004	Todd Boulanger	Attend [REDACTED] /White House meeting to gather intelligence on Senate schedule; [REDACTED]	Intl Interactive Alliance	2.1		GTG023627-ACCT-IIA
1/21/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Signatures restaurant with [REDACTED] staff and White House legislative staff.	Choctaw		\$56.03	GTG003272-ACCT-CW
1/21/2004	Shawn Vasell	Discussion with [REDACTED] and WH Leg. Aff. Staff at event; [REDACTED]	Coushatta	2.3		GTG001706-ACCT-CS
1/21/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] regarding mutual fund legislation; [REDACTED]; discussion with White House Legislative staff regarding the same; [REDACTED]	DH2	2.1		GTG026036-ACCT-DH2
1/23/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Signatures with [REDACTED] staff, White House Legislative Affairs and Senate Leadership staff.	Choctaw		\$47.30	GTG003272-ACCT-CW
1/23/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with S. Ralston (Bush Cheney 2004); [REDACTED]	Choctaw	2.1		GTG003264-ACCT-CW

Greenberg Traurig Billing Records that Contain References to White House Officials

Date	Greenberg Lobbyist	Description of White House Interaction	Client	Time Billed (hours)	Expenses Billed	Bates Number
1/27/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Signatures with [REDACTED] staff, White House Legislative Affairs and Senate Leadership staff	DH2		\$47.30	GTG026049-ACCT-DH2
1/27/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Signatures with [REDACTED] staff, White House Legislative Affairs and Senate Leadership staff.	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$47.30	GTG023637-ACCT-IIA
1/27/2004	Shawn Vasell	meal at Ceiba with White House staff and Bush-Cheney campaign staff.	Choctaw		\$105.73	GTG003273-ACCT-CW
1/27/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with [REDACTED] staff, Senate Leadership staff, House Leadership staff, [REDACTED] staff, and White House Legislative Affairs staff.	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$194.90	GTG023637-ACCT-IIA
1/29/2004	Shawn Vasell	Lunch at Breadline with White House staff.	Choctaw		\$15.79	GTG003268-ACCT-CW
1/29/2004	Shawn Vasell	meal at Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs and Chamber of Commerce staff.	Choctaw		\$116.39	GTG003274-ACCT-CW
1/31/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meal at Bistro Bis with White House Legislative Affairs and Chamber of Commerce staff.	Intl Interactive Alliance		\$116.39	GTG023637-ACCT-IIA
1/31/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with S. Raiston (White House/Bush-Cheney Re-elect; [REDACTED])	Choctaw	2.6		GTG003277-ACCT-CW
2/13/2004	Shawn Vasell	Meeting with [REDACTED] regarding mutual fund legislation; [REDACTED] discussion with WH Leg. Aff. Staff regarding the same; [REDACTED]	DH2	2.1		GTG026046-ACCT-DH2